
Los Altos Hills County Fire District  REVISED 
Agenda 

12355 El Monte Road, Los Altos Hills (Foothill College Campus)  

Regular Meeting of September 19, 2017    7:00 p.m.  
Revision No. 1, Friday September 15, 2017 

1) Roll Call.

2) Public Comment: Persons wishing to address the District on any subject, whether or not on the
agenda, may do so now. Please note, however, the District is not able to undertake extended
discussion or action tonight on items not on the agenda. Items may be referred to staff for appropriate
action, which may include placement on the next available agenda. Please note that, while the District
Board will hear comments upon items which are on the agenda at this time, the District will not act on
any such item until the item is under consideration by the District. District policy is to limit public
testimony to three minutes per speaker.

3) Resolution of the Board of the Los Altos Hills County Fire District to Proceed with
the Abatement of Brush.  Resolution 17-19

4) Review and Possible Acceptance of the 2016/17 Audit.

5) CERT Report:     a.) Ham Radio Proposal 
     b.) CERT Calendar August/September 
     c.) Spotlight Quarterly Report 

6) Chief’s Report:      a.) Monthly Report for July, 2017 
    b.) Monthly Report for August, 2017 

7) Consultant Report:   a.) Projects Update Dated September 1, 2017

8) Resolution of the Board of Directors of the Los Altos Hills County Fire District
Accepting as Completed the Work of the Fire Hydrant Replacement Project Phase
VIII, Authorizing Final Payment Concerning Such Work, and Directing the District
Clerk to File a Notice of Completion. Resolution 17-21

9) Resolution of the Board of the Los Altos Hills County Fire District Adopting a
Records Retention Schedule and Authorizing Destruction of Certain District
Records. Resolution  17-20

10) Sub-Committee, Contract and Non-Board Committee Reports:

a. Strategic Plan: Update from August 25, Ad Hoc Meeting
b. Website Update
c. Water Supply Subcommittee Update
d. Tree Subcommittee Report
e. Community Wildfire Protection Plan Sub-Committee Update



f. Current Contracts 
g. General Manager Subcommittee Update 

 
11) Consent Calendar:    a.) Minutes of Special Meeting July 25, 2017 

                 b.) Period Report 1, July, 2017 
     c.) Period Report 2, August, 2017 

 
12) Disbursements for August and September, 2017. 

 
13) District Board Authorization and Approval for O’Grady Paving, Inc. to Complete 

Necessary Repair Work, Including, but not Limited to, Access to Fire Hydrant 
Valves, Resulting From the Road Paving Work Performed by the Town of Los Altos 
Hills. 

 
14) Board Member Reports :  1) Discussion of Public Fire Prevention Event 

  2) Discussion of Meeting Date Change in October 
 

15) Adjournment. 
 
 
ASSISTANCE FOR PERSONS WITH DISABILITIES 
In compliance with the Americans with Disabilities Act, if you need special assistance to participate in this meeting 
please contact the secretary/clerk at (650) 948-2474. Notification 48 hours prior to the meeting will enable the 
District to make reasonable arrangements to ensure accessibility to this meeting (28 CFR 35.102-35.104 ADA Title 
II) 
 
 
Revision (1) 





LOS ALTOS HILLS COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT 
A COMPONENT UNIT OF THE COUNTY OF SANTA CLARA 

ANNUAL FINANCIAL REPORT 

YEAR ENDED JUNE 30, 2017 

WITH 

INDEPENDENT AUDITORS' REPORT 
 

mgresshoff
Draft



LOS ALTOS HILLS COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT 
YEAR ENDED JUNE 30, 2017 
 
TABLE OF CONTENTS 
 
 Pages 
  
INDEPENDENT AUDITORS' REPORT 1 
  
MANAGEMENT'S DISCUSSION AND ANALYSIS 4 
  
FINANCIAL STATEMENTS   

Government-wide Financial Statements  
Statement of Net Position 12 
Statement of Activities 13 

Fund Financial Statements  
Balance Sheet 14 
Reconciliation of the Governmental Fund Balance Sheet to the 
  Government-wide Statement of Net Position - Governmental Activities 

 
15 

Statement of Revenues, Expenditures, and Changes in Fund Balance 16 
Reconciliation of the Governmental Fund Statement of Revenues, 
  Expenditures, and Changes in Fund Balance to the  
  Statement of Activities - Governmental Activities 

 
 

17 
Notes to the Basic Financial Statements 19 

  
REQUIRED SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION   

Budgetary Comparison Schedule - General Fund 34 
  
INDEPENDENT AUDITORS' REPORT ON INTERNAL CONTROL OVER 

FINANCIAL REPORTING AND ON COMPLIANCE AND OTHER MATTERS 
BASED ON AN AUDIT OF FINANCIAL STATEMENTS PERFORMED IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH GOVERNMENT AUDITING STANDARDS  

 
 
 

35 
  
SUMMARY OF AUDITORS' RESULTS 37 
  
SUMMARY SCHEDULE OF PRIOR AUDIT FINDINGS 38 
  
 



   
 

1 
 

5000 Hopyard Road, Suite 335    Pleasanton, CA  94588    Tel: 925.734.6600    www.vtdcpa.com   Fax: 925.734.6611 

 
 

INDEPENDENT AUDITORS' REPORT 
 
 
 
To the Board of Commissioners of Los Altos Hills 
County Fire District 
Los Altos, California 
 
Report on Financial Statements 
 
We have audited the accompanying financial statements of the governmental activities and the General fund of the Los 
Altos Hills County Fire District (the "District"), a component unit of the County of Santa Clara, as of and for the year 
ended June 30, 2017, and the related notes to the financial statements, which collectively comprise the District's basic 
financial statements as listed in the table of contents. 
 
Management's Responsibility for the Financial Statements 
 
Management is responsible for the preparation and fair presentation of these financial statements in accordance 
with accounting principles generally accepted in the United States of America; this includes the design, 
implementation, and maintenance of internal control relevant to the preparation and fair presentation of financial 
statements that are free from material misstatement, whether due to fraud or error. 
 
Auditors' Responsibility 
 
Our responsibility is to express an opinion on these financial statements based on our audit. We conducted our audit in 
accordance with auditing standards generally accepted in the United States of America and the standards applicable to 
financial audits contained in Government Auditing Standards, issued by the Comptroller General of the United States. 
Those standards require that we plan and perform the audit to obtain reasonable assurance about whether the financial 
statements are free from material misstatement. 
 
An audit involves performing procedures to obtain audit evidence about the amounts and disclosures in the financial 
statements. The procedures selected depend on the auditor's judgment, including the assessment of the risks of 
material misstatement of the financial statements, whether due to fraud or error. In making those risk assessments, 
the auditor considers internal control relevant to the entity's preparation and fair presentation of the financial 
statements in order to design audit procedures that are appropriate in the circumstances, but not for the purpose of 
expressing an opinion on the effectiveness of the entity's internal control. Accordingly, we express no such opinion. 
An audit also includes evaluating the appropriateness of accounting policies used and the reasonableness of 
significant accounting estimates made by management, as well as evaluating the overall presentation of the financial 
statements. 
 
We believe that the audit evidence we have obtained is sufficient and appropriate to provide a basis for our audit 
opinions. 
 



 

2 

Opinions 
 
In our opinion, the financial statements referred to above present fairly, in all material respects, the respective financial 
position of the governmental activities and the General fund of the Los Altos Hills County Fire District, as of June 30, 
2017, and the respective changes in financial position for the year then ended in accordance with accounting principles 
generally accepted in the United States of America. 
 
Other Matters 
 
Required Supplementary Information 
 
Accounting principles generally accepted in the United States of America require that the management's discussion 
and analysis and budgetary comparison information, as listed in the table of contents, be presented to supplement the 
basic financial statements. Such information, although not a part of the basic financial statements, is required by the 
Governmental Accounting Standards Board, who considers it to be an essential part of financial reporting for placing 
the basic financial statements in an appropriate operational, economic, or historical context. We have applied certain 
limited procedures to the required supplementary information in accordance with auditing standards generally 
accepted in the United States of America, which consisted of inquires of management about the methods of preparing 
the information and comparing the information for consistency with management's responses to our inquiries, the 
basic financial statements, and other knowledge we obtained during our audit of the basic financial statements. We do 
not express an opinion or provide any assurance on the information because the limited procedures do not provide us 
with sufficient evidence to express an opinion or provide any assurance. 
 
Other Reporting Required by Government Auditing Standards 
 
In accordance with Government Auditing Standards, we have also issued our report dated September 8, 2017, on our 
consideration of the Los Altos Hills County Fire District's internal control over financial reporting and our tests of its 
compliance with certain provisions of laws, regulations, contracts, and grant agreements and other matters. The 
purpose of that report is to describe the scope of our testing of internal control over financial reporting and compliance 
and the results of that testing, and not to provide an opinion on the internal control over financial reporting or on 
compliance. That report is an integral part of an audit performed in accordance with Government Auditing Standards 
in considering Los Altos Hills County Fire District's internal control over financial reporting and compliance. 
 

 
Pleasanton, California  
September 8, 2017 
 



 

3 

MANAGEMENT'S DISCUSSION AND ANALYSIS 
 
 



LOS ALTOS HILLS COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT 
 
MANAGEMENT'S DISCUSSION AND ANALYIS 
YEAR ENDED JUNE 30, 2017 
 

4 

This section of the Los Altos Hills County Fire District (the 'District") annual financial report presents a 
discussion and analysis of the District's financial performance for the fiscal year ended June 30, 2017. The 
District's financial performance is discussed and analyzed within the context of the accompanying financial 
statements and disclosure following this section. 
 

FINANCIAL HIGHLIGHTS 
 

• The assets and deferred outflows of resources of the District exceeded liabilities and deferred inflows of 
resources by $15,108,936 (net position) for the fiscal year reported. Of this amount, $2,253,637 is net investment 
in capital assets, and $12,855,299 (unrestricted net position) may be used to meet ongoing obligations to citizens 
and creditors. The District had no deferred outflows or inflows of resources at year end. 

• The District's total net position increased by $1,615,029 during the fiscal year. 
• As of June 30, 2017, the District's general funds reported an ending fund balances of $12,855,299.  

Approximately 68% of this total amount, $8,755,299 is unassigned fund balance available for spending at 
the District's discretion.  The other $4,100,000 (32%) was committed for various purposes.   

• At the end of the fiscal year, unassigned fund balance for the general fund was 98% of total general fund 
expenditures. 

• Under the Purissima Hills Fire Hydrant Replacement Project, 84 hydrants were replaced or serviced during 
fiscal year 2016-2017 at an average cost of approximately $10,000 (cost varies according to specific needs 
of each hydrant/location that are often not visible prior to excavation). It is anticipated that the program will 
be complete in fiscal year 2016-2017. The program was originally scheduled to be completed during fiscal 
year 2016-2017, but the final phase of construction had a late start due to inclement winter weather, and 
will now be completed in the early part of fiscal year 2017-2018. 

• During fiscal year 2016-2017, 907 trees were removed or pruned under the Tree Removal and Pruning Program. 
This program has proven to be both effective in fuel load reduction as well as popular with the constituents. 
Spending on this program is entirely discretionary by the Board and spending can be increased or decreased 
quickly based on budgetary constraints. Tree spending decreased this year due to a new contract process in 
which contractors competitively bid to remove/prune all trees in a specific area, rather than billing on a tree-by-
tree basis as was done in the past. 
 

OVERVIEW OF THE FINANCIAL STATEMENTS 
 

This discussion and analysis is intended to serve as an introduction to the District's basic financial statements. The 
District's basic financial statements comprise three components: (1) Government-wide financial statements, (2) 
Fund financial statements, and (3) Notes to the basic financial statements. Required Supplementary Information is 
included in addition to the basic financial statements. 
 
Government-wide Financial Statements 
The government-wide financial statements are designed to provide readers with a broad overview of the District's 
finances, in a manner similar to a private-sector business. 
 
The statement of net position presents information on all of the District's assets, deferred outflows of resources, 
liabilities, and deferred inflows of resources, with the difference reported as net position. Over time, increases or 
decreases in net position may serve as a useful indicator of whether or not the financial position of the District is 
improving or deteriorating. 



LOS ALTOS HILLS COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT 
 
MANAGEMENT'S DISCUSSION AND ANALYIS 
YEAR ENDED JUNE 30, 2017 
 

5 

The statement of activities presents information showing how the District's net position changed during the most recent 
fiscal year. All changes in net position are reported as soon as the underlying event giving rise to the change occurs, 
regardless of the timing of related cash flows. Thus, revenues and expenses are reported in this statement for some 
items that will only result in cash flows in future fiscal periods, such as revenues pertaining to uncollected taxes.  
 
Both of the government-wide financial statements distinguish functions of the District that are principally supported 
by taxes and intergovernmental revenues (governmental activities) from other functions that are intended to recover 
all or a significant portion of their costs through user fees and charges (business-type activities). The only 
governmental activity of the District is public protection – fire district. The District does not currently have any 
business-type activities. 
 
Fund Financial Statements 
 
The fund financial statements are designed to report information about groupings of related accounts which are used to 
maintain control over resources that have been segregated for specific activities or objectives. The District, like other 
state and local governments, uses fund accounting to ensure and demonstrate compliance with finance-related legal 
requirements. The one fund of the District can be categorized as a governmental fund. 
 
Governmental fund – (General Fund) is used to account for essentially the same functions reported as governmental 
activities in the government-wide financial statements—i.e. the District's basic services are reported in the 
governmental fund. These statements, however, focus on (1) how cash and other financial assets can readily be 
converted to available resources and (2) the balances left at year-end that are available for spending. Such information 
may be useful in determining what financial resources are available in the near future to finance the District's programs. 
 
Because the focus of the governmental fund is narrower than that of the government-wide financial statements, it is 
useful to compare the information presented for the governmental fund with similar information presented for 
governmental activities in the government-wide financial statements. By doing so, readers may better understand the 
long-term impact of the government's near-term financial decisions. Both the governmental fund balance sheet and the 
governmental fund statement of revenues, expenditures and changes in fund balance provide a reconciliation to 
facilitate this comparison between the governmental fund and governmental activities. 
 
The District maintains only one individual governmental fund. Information is presented separately in the 
governmental fund balance sheet and in the governmental fund statement of revenues, expenditures, and changes 
in fund balance for the general fund, which is considered to be a major fund. 
 
The District does not have any proprietary or fiduciary funds.  
 
Notes to the Basic Financial Statements 
 
The notes to the basic financial statements provide additional information that is essential to a full understanding 
of the data provided in the government-wide and fund financial statements. 
 
Required Supplementary Information 
 
The required supplementary information is presented concerning the District's General Fund budgetary 
comparison schedule. The District adopts an annual appropriated budget for its General Fund. A budgetary 
comparison statement has been provided for the General Fund to demonstrate compliance with this budget. 



LOS ALTOS HILLS COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT 
 
MANAGEMENT'S DISCUSSION AND ANALYIS 
YEAR ENDED JUNE 30, 2017 
 

6 

GOVERNMENT-WIDE FINANCIAL ANALYSIS 
 
As noted earlier, net position may serve over time as a useful indicator of a government's financial position. In 
the case of the District, assets exceeded liabilities by $15,108,936 at the close of the most recent fiscal year. 
 

Net Position 
 

2017 2016 $ Change Variance (%)
Assets:

Current assets 13,143,124$        11,499,934$       1,643,190$       14%
Capital assets 2,253,637            2,329,342           (75,705)            -3%                       

Total assets 15,396,761          13,829,276         1,567,485         11%

Liabilities:
Current 287,825               335,369              47,544              14%

Total liabilities 287,825               335,369              47,544              14%

Net position:
Net invested in capital assets 2,253,637            2,329,342           (75,705)            -3%
Unrestricted 12,855,299          11,164,565         1,690,734         15%

Total net position 15,108,936$        13,493,907$       1,615,029$       12%

Governmental Activities

 
 

Analysis of Net Position 
 
The largest portion of the District's net position (85%) reflects amounts not restricted for any project or any other 
purpose. The other 15% of net position represent its net investment in capital assets (e.g. land, improvements, fire 
hydrants, furniture and equipment). The District uses these capital assets to provide services to citizens; 
consequently, these assets are not available for future spending. At the close of the most recent fiscal year, there was 
no debt outstanding related to acquisition of capital assets. 
 
At the end of the current fiscal year, the District reported positive balances in both categories of net position. The 
District's net position increased by $1,615,029 during the current fiscal year, compared to the $402,675 decrease 
in 2016.  



LOS ALTOS HILLS COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT 
 
MANAGEMENT'S DISCUSSION AND ANALYIS 
YEAR ENDED JUNE 30, 2017 
 

7 

The following table indicates the changes in net position for governmental activities: 
 

Changes in Net Position 
 

2017 2016 $ Change Variance (%)
Revenues:
General revenues:

Property taxes 10,406,581$       9,752,108$      654,473$       7%
Intergovernmental: State 45,222 46,557 (1,335)           -3%
Interest and investment income 99,372 71,771 27,601           38%
Property rental 11,000 5,500 5,500             100%
Other revenue 535                     -                       535                100%

Total revenues 10,562,710         9,875,936        686,774         7%

Expenses:
Public protection 8,947,681 10,278,611 1,330,930      13%

Change in net position 1,615,029           (402,675)         2,017,704      501%

Net position, beginning of year 13,493,907 13,896,582 (402,675)       -3%
Net position, end of year 15,108,936$       13,493,907$    1,615,029$    12%

Governmental Activities

 
 

Analysis of Changes in Net Position 
 
Key elements of the increase of $2,017,704 are as follows: 
 

• Total expenses decreased by $1,330,930 mostly due to the completion of the Page Mill Tank Seismic 
Retrofit Project in fiscal year 2015-2016, and the new competitive bidding process of the Tree Removal 
and Pruning Program. 
 

• Property taxes increased by $654,473 because of the annual inflation factor, not to exceed 2%, catch up in 
temporary valuation reductions caused by the recession and both increased sales activity of existing single-
family homes as well as an increase in the median sales price of those homes. 



LOS ALTOS HILLS COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT 
 
MANAGEMENT'S DISCUSSION AND ANALYIS 
YEAR ENDED JUNE 30, 2017 
 

8 

FINANCIAL ANALYSIS OF THE DISTRICT'S FUNDS 
 

As noted earlier, the District uses fund accounting to ensure and demonstrate compliance with finance-related 
legal requirements. 
 
Governmental Fund 
 
The general government functions are contained in the General Fund. The focus of the District's governmental 
funds is to provide information on near-term inflows, outflows, and balance of spendable resources. Such 
information is useful in assessing the District's financing requirements. In particular, unassigned fund balance 
may serve as a useful measure of a government's net resources available for spending at the end of the fiscal year. 
 
At June 30, 2017, the District's governmental fund reported an ending fund balance of $12,855,299, an increase of 
$1,690,734 in comparison with the prior year. Approximately 68% of the ending fund balance, $8,755,299, constitutes 
unassigned fund balance, which is available to meet the District's current and future needs.  The remaining $4,100,000 
(32%) of the fund balance has been committed for insurance, emergency operations and general operations in 
periods where minimal property tax revenue is forthcoming. 
 
Revenues for governmental functions totaled $10,562,710 in fiscal year 2016-2017, which represents an increase of 7% 
from fiscal year ended 2015-2016. Expenditures for governmental functions, which totaled $8,871,976, decreased by 
approximately 13% from the fiscal year 2015-2016. In the fiscal year 2016-2017, revenues exceeded expenses for 
governmental functions by $1,690,734. 
 
The following table presents the amount of revenues from various sources as well as increases or decreases 
from the prior year. 

Revenues Classified by Source 
Governmental Fund 

 

Revenues by Source Amount Amount Amount
Property taxes 10,406,581$   99% 9,752,108$  99% $654,473 7%
Intergovernmental: State 45,222            0% 46,557         0% (1,335)      -3%
Interest and investment income 99,372            1% 71,771         1% 27,601      38%
Property rental 11,000            0% 5,500           0% 5,500        100%
Other revenue 535                 0% -                   0% 535           0%

Total $10,562,710 100% $9,875,936 100% $686,774 7%

2017 2016 Increase/(Decrease)

% of Total
% of 
Total

% of 
Total

 
Property taxes, the main District revenue, increased by about 7% because of the annual inflation factor, not to 
exceed 2%, catch up in temporary valuation reductions caused by the recession and both increased sales activity of 
existing single family homes as well as an increase in the median sales price of those homes. 
 



LOS ALTOS HILLS COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT 
 
MANAGEMENT'S DISCUSSION AND ANALYIS 
YEAR ENDED JUNE 30, 2017 
 

9 

GENERAL FUND BUDGETARY HIGHLIGHTS 
 

During the year, actual revenues were more than budgetary estimates by $512,710. Property tax was more than 
budgetary estimate by $451,681. Intergovernmental revenues had a negative variance of $778. Interest and 
investment income reflected a positive variance of $54,372, property rental had positive a variance of $8,000, and 
other income showed a negative variance of $565. Expenditures were less than budgetary estimates by 
$1,452,025. There was a positive variance in capital outlay of $703,801 and services and supplies of $748,224. 
The positive variances are mostly attributable to construction costs on the Purissima Hills Fire Hydrant 
Replacement Project coming in substantially below the engineer’s estimate, a delay in starting the eighth phase of 
the hydrant project, the new bidding process for the Tree Removal and Pruning Program, a conservative 
budgeting philosophy, as well as larger than expected increase in property values. 

 
CAPITAL ASSETS 

 
The District's net investment in capital assets for its governmental activities as of June 30, 2017, amounted to 
$2,253,637 (net of accumulated depreciation). This investment in capital assets includes land, improvements, 
fire hydrants, furniture and equipment. 
 
For government-wide financial statement presentation, all depreciable capital assets were depreciated from 
acquisition date to the end of the current fiscal year. Fund financial statements record capital asset purchases as 
expenditures. 
 
Capital assets for the governmental activities are presented below to illustrate changes from the prior year: 
 

Increase/(decrease)
2017 2016 $ Change % of change

Land 4,688$              4,688$              -$                      0%
Improvements 2,552,838         2,552,838         -                        0%
Fire hydrants 1,078,745         1,078,745         -                        0%
Furniture and equipment 63,118              63,118              -                        0%
Less: Accumulated depreciation (1,445,752)        (1,370,047)        (75,705)             -6%

Total 2,253,637$       2,329,342$       (75,705)$           -3%

Governmental Activities

 
See Note 5 for additional information on capital assets. 
 

ECONOMIC FACTORS AND NEXT YEAR'S BUDGET AND RATES 
 

The District’s strong fund balance has enabled it to undertake costly but essential fire prevention projects, such 
as reducing the fuel load and expanding the water supply for fire suppression through extension of the network 
of larger water mains, and the upgrading of water tanks and hydrants. For the Purissima Hills Fire Hydrant 
Replacement Project, $1,301,771 has been spent on hydrant upgrades and water mainlines for the period 2016-
2017, while $470,000 has been estimated for the final year of the program in 2017-2018.  For the Tree Removal 
and Pruning Program, $1,087,389 was expended in 2016-2017, while $1,000,000 was estimated for 2017-2018. 



LOS ALTOS HILLS COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT 
 
MANAGEMENT'S DISCUSSION AND ANALYIS 
YEAR ENDED JUNE 30, 2017 
 

10 

For 2017-2018, the District will work with the Purissima Hills Water District and the California Water Service 
to improve water flow within the community in order to meet fire-flow standards.  The Fire Service Water Flow 
Improvement Program has been budgeted at $1,500,000 for the fiscal year 2017-2018 to cover planning, 
engineering and preliminary costs, with the project expected to span multiple years. 
 
As for future funding and increased services, it is projected that tax revenues will continue to rise as a result of 
inflation, replacement of older ranch homes with larger structures, and increasing valuations. Revenues have 
been budgeted at $10,905,760, a 3.2% increase for 2017-2018, however, the budget was prepared prior to the 
7% increase in 2016-2017 being known and is therefore expected to be higher.  Expenses are expected to 
increase 12.7% to $10,002,522 primarily due to the Fire Service Water Flow Improvement Program which will 
begin in fiscal year 2017-2018. All of these factors were considered in preparing the District's budget for fiscal year 
2017. 

 
REQUESTS FOR INFORMATION 

 
This financial report is designed to provide a general overview of the District's finances for all those with an 
interest in the government's finances. Questions concerning any of the information provided in this report or 
requests for additional financial information should be addressed to Los Altos Hills County Fire District, P.O. 
Box 1766, Los Altos, CA 94023-1766. 



 

11 

BASIC FINANCIAL STATEMENTS 
 



LOS ALTOS HILLS COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT 
 
STATEMENT OF NET POSITION 
JUNE 30, 2017 
 

See accompanying notes to financial statements. 
12 

 
Assets

Cash and investments 13,127,770$                   
Interest receivable 15,354                            
Capital assets

Land 4,688                              
Building improvements 2,552,838                       
Fire hydrants 1,078,745                       
Furniture and equipment 63,118                            
Accumulated depreciation (1,445,752)                     

Total Assets 15,396,761                     

Liabilities
Accounts payable 287,825

Total Liabilities 287,825                          

Net Position
Net investment in capital assets 2,253,637
Unrestricted 12,855,299

Total Net Position 15,108,936$                   

 
 



LOS ALTOS HILLS COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT 
 
STATEMENT OF ACTIVITIES 
YEAR ENDED JUNE 30, 2017 

See accompanying notes to financial statements. 
13 

 

Functions/Programs

Governmental Activities Expenses
Governmental 

Activities
Public protection  $        8,947,681  $        8,947,681 

Total Governmental Activities  $        8,947,681            8,947,681 
General Revenues

Taxes
Property taxes          10,406,581 

Intergovernmental: State                 45,222 
Interest and investment income                 99,372 
Property rental                 11,000 
Other revenues                      535 

Total General Revenues 10,562,710 

Change in Net Position 1,615,029 

Net Position, Beginning of Year 13,493,907

Net Position, End of Year  $      15,108,936 

Net (Expenses)
Revenue and

Changes in Net
Position

 



LOS ALTOS HILLS COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT 
 
BALANCE SHEET – GOVERNMENTAL FUND 
JUNE 30, 2017 
 

See accompanying notes to financial statements. 
14 

 
General Fund

Assets
Cash and investments 13,127,770$        
Interest receivable 15,354                 

Total Assets 13,143,124$        

Liabilities
Accounts payable and accrued liabilities 287,825

Total Liabilities 287,825               

Fund Balances
Committed

Insurance 100,000
Operations 2,000,000
Emergency operations 2,000,000

Unassigned 8,755,299
Total Fund Balance 12,855,299          

Total Liabilities and Fund Balance 13,143,124$        



LOS ALTOS HILLS COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT 
 
RECONCILIATION OF THE GOVERNMENTAL FUND BALANCE SHEET TO  
THE STATEMENT OF NET POSITION 
JUNE 30, 2017 
 

See accompanying notes to financial statements. 
15 

 
Fund Balance - Total Governmental Fund 12,855,299$    

Amounts reported for governmental activities in the statement
of net position are different because:

Capital assets used in governmental activities are capitalized
and depreciated over their useful lives in the government wide 
statements, but recorded as an expenditure in the governmental funds. 2,253,637

Net Position of Governmental Activities 15,108,936$    



LOS ALTOS HILLS COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT 
 
STATEMENT OF REVENUES, EXPENDITURES, AND CHANGES IN FUND 
BALANCE 
GOVERNMENTAL FUND 
YEAR ENDED JUNE 30, 2017 
 

See accompanying notes to financial statements. 
16 

 
General Fund

Revenues
Property taxes  $           10,406,581 
Intergovernmental: State 45,222 
Interest and investment income 99,372 
Property rental 11,000 
Other revenues 535 

Total Revenues 10,562,710 

Expenditures - Public Protection
Services and supplies 7,570,205 
Capital outlay 1,301,771 

Total Expenditures                 8,871,976 

Net Change in Fund Balance 1,690,734               

Fund Balance, Beginning of Year               11,164,565 

Fund Balance, End of Year  $           12,855,299 

 
 



LOS ALTOS HILLS COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT 
 
RECONCILIATION OF THE GOVERNMENTAL FUND STATEMENT OF 
REVENUES, EXPENDITURES, AND CHANGES IN FUND BALANCE TO THE 
STATEMENT OF ACTIVITIES  
YEAR ENDED JUNE 30, 2017 
 

See accompanying notes to financial statements. 
17 

 
Net Change in Fund Balance - Total Governmental Fund 1,690,734$        

Amounts reported for governmental activities in the statement of activities are 
different because:
Governmental funds report capital outlay as expenditures. However, in the statement
  of activities, the cost of those assets are allocated over their estimated useful lives
  and reported as depreciation expense.

Current year depreciation (75,705)              

Change in Net postion of Governmental Activities 1,615,029$        

 
 



 

18 

NOTES TO THE FINANCIAL STATEMENTS



LOS ALTOS HILLS COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT 
 
NOTES TO THE BASIC FINANCIAL STATEMENTS 
YEAR ENDED JUNE 30, 2017 
 

19 

NOTE 1 - GENERAL INFORMATION 
 

A. Organization 
 

The Los Altos Hills County Fire District (the "District") was organized on October 23, 1939 and operates in 
conformity with the provisions of Part 2.7 of Division 12 of the California Health and Safety Code. The 
District is composed of the Town of Los Altos Hills and the unincorporated areas generally referred to as the 
Loyola, Los Trancos / Alpine Road and San Antonio Hills. The District comprises an area of about 12.03 
square miles. 
 
The District has augmented fire protection to its residents in the past by purchasing the following: 

 
1, Weather station for use by the Santa Clara County Central Fire Protection District 

("Central Fire District") for monitoring weather during high fire hazard days 
2. Specialized fire apparatus for use in the high hazard brush and grass fire areas 
3. New rescue apparatus unit for Central Fire District prior to its life expectancy expiration 
4. Specialized rescue tools 
5. State-of-the-art fire hydrant and water main testing equipment 
6. Specialized medical equipment 
7. Two CERT Trailers (CFPD has the titles) and 1 ARK Storage Container 
8. Edgerton Road and Deer Springs Way Fire Road Pavement Rehabilitation 
9. Neary Tank Upgrade Project 
10. Page Mill Tank Upgrade Project 

 
The District also conducts the following programs for its residents: 
 

1. Replacement of undersized water mains and installation of new water mains and fire 
hydrants as needed  

2. A brush chipping program is offered free of charge twice a year to all residents living in 
the District 

3. Additional staffing (firefighters) during summer fire season 
4. A garden debris drop-off program is funded by the District and operated by the garbage 

company, which allows residents to drop-off garden debris and other combustible plant 
materials once a month at a central drop-off area free of charge 

5. Funding of a fuel reduction/fire break program at the Byrne Preserve through the use of 
goats 

6. The annual mailing of fire prevention and emergency preparedness information to all 
District residents 

7. An emergency preparedness coordinator at a half time position 
8. Tree Pruning and Removal Program to reduce fire hazard 
9. The seismic upgrading of water tanks 
 



LOS ALTOS HILLS COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT 
 
NOTES TO THE BASIC FINANCIAL STATEMENTS 
YEAR ENDED JUNE 30, 2017 
 

20 

NOTE 1 - GENERAL INFORMATION (Continued) 
 

B. District Officials 
 

The District is governed by a seven member Board of Commissioners (the "Commission"), appointed by the 
County of Santa Clara (the "County") Board of Supervisors for four-year terms, pursuant to the provisions of 
the Health and Safety Code Section 13884. Appointments to the Commission are made to provide for equal 
representation on the basis of population, as between residents of incorporated and unincorporated territories, 
respectively. A Commissioner must be a resident of the District. Commissioners are subject to removal for 
cause. The County Board of Supervisors delegates all of its powers to the Commission to manage the affairs 
of the District; provided, however, that the Commission shall not initiate litigation without the prior approval 
of the Board of Supervisors. 
 
The District is considered a component unit of the County and the District's financial statements are 
blended into the County's financial statements. The Commission is composed of the following as of June 
30, 2017: 
 

 Term Expires 
Dec. 31 

George Tyson, President 2018 
Melvin Vaughn, Vice-President 2018 
Janice Carr 2020 
Mark Warren 2020 
Roger Spreen 2019 
Duffy Price  2020 
Gary Waldeck 2017 

 
C. Accounts and Records 

 
The basic financial records are maintained in the office of the County's Auditor-Controller. The District 
maintains supporting vouchers and other records. Minutes were recorded and contained approvals for 
disbursements. 
 
D. Budgetary Procedures 
 
The District is required by state law to adopt a budget for the General Fund. The budget is prepared on the 
modified accrual basis of accounting, which is consistent with generally accepted accounting principles. 
 
The annual budget is prepared, adopted and then submitted by the Commission to the County Board of 
Supervisors for final approval. Once the budget is approved, it can be amended at the Function and Fund level 
only by the approval of a majority of the Commission. Such amendments are presented to the Board at their 
regular meetings. All amendments are made before the fact and are reflected in the official minutes of the 
Board. Finally, all amendments are subsequently submitted to the County Board of Supervisors. All budget 
appropriations lapse at year-end. Encumbrance accounting is not used. 

 



LOS ALTOS HILLS COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT 
 
NOTES TO THE BASIC FINANCIAL STATEMENTS 
YEAR ENDED JUNE 30, 2017 
 

21 

NOTE 1 - GENERAL INFORMATION (Continued) 
 

E. Appropriations Limit 
 

The County Board of Supervisors computes the appropriations limit for special districts that are 
governed by them. The County's auditors review these annual calculations. 

 
 
NOTE 2. - SUMMARY OF SIGNIFICANT ACCOUNTING POLICIES 
 

The basic financial statements of the District have been prepared in conformity with accounting principles 
generally accepted in the United States of America (GAAP) as applied to local governmental units. The 
Governmental Accounting Standards Board (GASB) is the accepted standard-setting body for establishing 
governmental accounting and financial principles. The most significant of the District's accounting policies 
are described below. 

 
A. Basis of Presentation 

 
Government-wide Financial Statements 
 
The statement of net position and statement of activities display information about the District. These 
statements include the financial activities of the overall government. Governmental activities are normally 
supported by taxes and intergovernmental revenues. 
 
The statement of activities presents a comparison between direct expenses and program revenues for each 
function of the governmental activities. Direct expenses are those that are specifically associated with a 
service, program or department and are therefore clearly identifiable to a particular function. Program 
revenues would include charges paid by the recipients of goods or services offered by the programs. 
Revenues that are not classified as program revenues, including various taxes, are presented as general 
revenues. The comparison of program revenues and expenses identifies the extent to which each program is 
self-financing or draws from the general revenues of the District. 
 
Fund Financial Statements 
 
Fund financial statements are organized into funds, each of which is considered to be a separate accounting 
entities. Each fund is accounted for by providing a separate set of self-balancing accounts that constitute its 
assets, liabilities, deferred inflows, deferred outflows, fund equity, revenues, and expenditures/expenses. 
Funds are organized into three major categories: governmental, proprietary, and fiduciary. There are separate 
statements for each fund category. The emphasis of fund financial statements is on major governmental and 
enterprise funds rather than reporting funds by type. Each major fund is presented in a separate column. Non-
major funds are aggregated and presented in a single column. The internal service fund is presented in a 
single column in the proprietary fund financial statements. The District has only one fund, the General fund. 



LOS ALTOS HILLS COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT 
 
NOTES TO THE BASIC FINANCIAL STATEMENTS 
YEAR ENDED JUNE 30, 2017 
 

22 

NOTE 2. - SUMMARY OF SIGNIFICANT ACCOUNTING POLICIES (Continued) 
 

Governmental Fund 
 
The District reports one major governmental fund: 
 
• The General Fund is the general operating fund of the District and is always classified as a major fund. It is 
used to account for all revenues and expenditures necessary to carry out basic governmental activities of the 
District that are not required to be accounted for through other funds. For the District, the General Fund's 
primary activity is public protection. 

 
B. Measurement Focus and Basis of Accounting 

 
Measurement focus is a term used to describe "which" transactions are recorded within the various 
financial statements. Basis of accounting refers to "when" transactions are recorded regardless of the 
measurement focus applied. 
 
The government-wide, proprietary, and fiduciary fund financial statements are prepared using the economic 
resources measurement focus and the accrual basis of accounting. This differs from the manner in which 
governmental fund financial statements are prepared. Therefore, governmental fund financial statements 
include a reconciliation with brief explanations to better identify the relationship between the government-
wide statements and the statements for governmental funds. The District has no proprietary or fiduciary 
funds. 
 
The accounting objectives of the economic resources measurement focus are the determination of 
operating income, changes in net position (or cost recovery), financial position, and cash flows. All 
assets, deferred outflows, liabilities, and deferred inflows (whether current or noncurrent) associated 
with their activities are reported. The residual amount is classified as net position. 
 
Under the accrual basis of accounting, revenues are recorded when earned and expenses are recorded at 
the time liabilities are incurred or economic asset used. Revenues, expenses, gains, losses, assets, and 
liabilities resulting from exchange and exchange-like transactions are recognized when the exchange 
takes place. Nonexchange transactions, in which the District gives (or receives) value without directly 
receiving (or giving) equal value in exchange, include property taxes. On an accrual basis, revenue from 
property taxes is recognized in the fiscal year for which the taxes are levied. 
 
The governmental fund financial statements are prepared using the current financial resources measurement 
focus and the modified accrual basis of accounting. 

 
 



LOS ALTOS HILLS COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT 
 
NOTES TO THE BASIC FINANCIAL STATEMENTS 
YEAR ENDED JUNE 30, 2017 
 

23 

NOTE 2. - SUMMARY OF SIGNIFICANT ACCOUNTING POLICIES (Continued) 
 

In the current financial resources measurement focus, only current assets and liabilities are generally included 
on the balance sheets. The operating statements present sources and uses of available spendable financial 
resources during a given period. The fund balance is used as the measure of available spendable financial 
resources at the end of the period. 
 
Under the modified accrual basis of accounting, revenues are recognized when measurable and available. 
Measurable means knowing or being able to reasonably estimate the amount. Available means collectible 
within the current period or within sixty days after year end. Expenditures (including capital outlay) are 
generally recorded when the related liability is incurred. 

 
C. Property Tax Levy, Collection, and Maximum Rate 

 
The State's Constitution, Article XIII A provides that the combined maximum property tax rate on any 
given property may not exceed 1% of its assessed value unless an additional amount for general obligation 
debt has been approved by the voters. Assessed value is calculated at 100% of market value as defined by 
Article XIII A and may be increased by no more than 2% per year unless the property is sold or transferred. 
These general property tax rates do not apply to taxes levied to pay the interest and redemption charges on 
any indebtedness incurred prior to June 6, 1978, or subsequently approved by the voters. Supplemental 
property taxes are levied on a pro rata basis when changes in assessed valuation occur due to sales 
transactions or the completion of construction. The State Legislature has determined the method of 
distribution among the counties, cities, school, districts, and other districts of receipts from the 1% property 
tax levy. 
 
The County assesses properties, bills for, and collects property taxes as follows: 
 

Secured Unsecured
Lien dates January 1 January 1
Levy dates October 1 July 1
Due dates 50% on November 1 Upon receipt of billing

50% on February 1
Delinquent after December 10 (for November)

April 10 (for February)
August 31

 
 
These taxes are secured by liens on the property being taxed. The Board of Supervisors annually sets the 
rates of the County and District taxes, and levies State, County, and District taxes as provided by law. The 
term "secured" refers to taxes on land and buildings, while "unsecured" refers to taxes on personal 
property other than land and buildings. 

 



LOS ALTOS HILLS COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT 
 
NOTES TO THE BASIC FINANCIAL STATEMENTS 
YEAR ENDED JUNE 30, 2017 
 

24 

NOTE 2. - SUMMARY OF SIGNIFICANT ACCOUNTING POLICIES (Continued) 
 

The County bills and collects property taxes and remits them to the District under the State authorized 
method of apportioning taxes whereby all local agencies, including special districts, receive from the 
County their respective shares of the amounts of ad valorem taxes collected. 
 
In 1981, the District passed an ordinance to impose a special tax pursuant to the provisions of the 
California Government Code Section 53978 on real property within the District for fire protection and 
related services. The District has not imposed this tax since 1986. The maximum annual special tax 
assessment that a parcel can be charged is as follows: 
 
Unimproved Parcels - $15 per 5 acres or fraction thereof, with a maximum of $60.  
Improved Residential Parcels - $50. 
Improved Commercial Parcels - $75. 

 
D. Capital Assets 

 
In the government-wide financial statements, capital assets (fixed assets) are those purchased or acquired 
with an original cost of $5,000 or more and are recorded at historical cost or at estimated historical cost if 
actual historical cost is not available. Donated capital assets are valued at their estimated acquisition value 
on the date of donation. 
 
Depreciation of all exhaustible capital assets is recorded as an allocated expense in the Statement of 
Activities, with accumulated depreciation reflected in the Statement of Net Position. Depreciation expense is 
provided over the assets' estimated useful lives using the straight-line method of depreciation. The estimated 
useful lives by type of asset are as follows: 
 

Improvements 50 years
Fire hydrants 50 years
Furniture & equipment 3 to 5 years  

 
Maintenance and repairs are charged to operations when incurred. Betterments and major improvements 
which significantly increase values, change capacities or extend useful lives are capitalized. Upon sale or 
retirement of capital assets, the cost and related accumulated depreciation are removed from the respective 
accounts and any resulting gain or loss is included in the results of operations. 
 
In the fund financial statements, capital assets used in governmental fund operations are accounted for as 
capital outlay expenditures of the governmental fund upon acquisition. Upon sale of capital assets, the 
proceeds from sale of capital assets are included in the results of operations as other financing sources. 

 



LOS ALTOS HILLS COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT 
 
NOTES TO THE BASIC FINANCIAL STATEMENTS 
YEAR ENDED JUNE 30, 2017 
 

25 

NOTE 2. - SUMMARY OF SIGNIFICANT ACCOUNTING POLICIES (Continued) 
 

E. Equity Classifications 
 

In government-wide and proprietary fund financial statements, equity is classified as net position and 
divided into three components: 
 
• Net Investment In Capital Assets — This category groups all capital assets into one component of net 
position. Accumulated depreciation and the outstanding balances of debt that are attributable to the 
acquisition, construction or improvement of these assets reduce the balance in this category. 
 
• Restricted — This category presents external restrictions imposed by creditors, grantors, 
contributors or laws or regulations of other governments and restrictions imposed by law through 
constitutional provisions or enabling legislation. 
 
• Unrestricted — This category represents net position of the District, not restricted for any project or 
other purpose. 
 
Governmental funds report fund balances in classifications based primarily on the extent to which the 
District is bound to honor constraints on the specific purposes for which amounts in the funds can be 
spent. Fund balance for governmental funds can consist of the following: 
 
• Nonspendable Fund Balance — includes amounts that are (a) not in spendable form—such as 
inventory, prepaid amounts or long-term notes receivable, or (b) legally or contractually required to be 
maintained intact—such as a trust that must be retained in perpetuity. The "not in spendable form" 
criterion includes items that are not expected to be converted to cash. 
  
• Restricted Fund Balance — constraints placed on the use of resources are either (a) externally imposed by 
creditors, grantors, contributors, or laws or regulations of other governments or (b) imposed by law through 
constitutional provisions or enabling legislation. Restriction may effectively be changed or lifted only with 
the consent of resource providers. 
 
• Committed Fund Balance — amounts that can only be used for the specific purposes determined by a 
formal action of the District's highest level of decision-making authority, the Board. Commitments may 
be changed or lifted by the District taking the same formal action that imposed the constraint originally. 
 
• Assigned Fund Balance — comprises amounts intended to be used by the District for specific purposes 
that are neither restricted nor committed. Intent is expressed by (a) the District's Board or (b) a body (e.g., a 
budget or finance committee) or official to which the District's Board has delegated the authority to assign, 
modify, rescind amounts to be used for specific purposes. With the exception of the General Fund, this is the 
residual fund balance classification for all governmental funds with positive balances. 
 
• Unassigned Fund Balance — the residual classification for the General Fund. It is also used to report 
negative fund balance in other governmental funds. 
 
In circumstances when an expenditure is made for a purpose for which amounts are available in multiple 
fund balance classifications, fund balance is generally depleted in the order of restricted, committed, 
assigned, and unassigned. 



LOS ALTOS HILLS COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT 
 
NOTES TO THE BASIC FINANCIAL STATEMENTS 
YEAR ENDED JUNE 30, 2017 
 

26 

NOTE 2. - SUMMARY OF SIGNIFICANT ACCOUNTING POLICIES (Continued) 
 

F. Estimates 
 

The preparation of basic financial statements in conformity with generally accepted accounting principles 
requires management to make estimates and assumptions that affect certain reported amounts and disclosures. 
Accordingly, actual results could differ from those estimates. 
 
G. Subsequent Events 

 
Management has evaluated the subsequent events through September 8, 2017.  

 
 
 

 
 

 



LOS ALTOS HILLS COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT 
 
NOTES TO THE BASIC FINANCIAL STATEMENTS 
YEAR ENDED JUNE 30, 2017 
 

27 

NOTE 3. - CASH AND INVESTMENTS 
 

Available cash balances of the District are invested in the Santa Clara County Treasury Pool ("Pool") for the 
purpose of increasing earnings through investment activities. The County's commingled pool consist of cash in 
bank, U.S. government and agency securities, corporate bonds, negotiable certificates of deposit, commercial 
paper, and deposits in the State's Local Agency Investment Fund. The County's pooled deposits and 
investments are regulated by California Government Code and by a County investment policy approved 
annually by the County Treasury Oversight Committee and the Board. The pooled investments' fair value is 
based on quoted market prices. The County allocates interest to the District based on the District's average 
daily cash balance relative to the entire Pool. The value of the participants' pool shares that may be withdrawn 
is determined on an amortized basis, which is different than the fair value of the participants' positions in the 
pool. In addition, the County's investment pool is not rated by any of the credit rating agencies. Additional 
information regarding the County's investment policy and cash and investments, including interest rate risk, 
credit risk, custodial credit risk categories, and maturities of the different categories of investments, can be 
found in the County's notes to the basic financial statements. 
 
Cash and investments at June 30, 2017 consist of the following: 
 

Carrying 
Amount Fair Value

County Treasury Pool 13,127,220$     13,127,220$     
Petty Cash 500                   500                   

Total cash and investments 13,127,720$     13,127,720$     

 
 

Governmental Accounting Standards Board (GASB), Statement No. 31, Accounting and Financial 
Reporting for Certain Investment and for External Investment Pools, establishes accounting and 
financial reporting standards for all investments held by governmental external investment pools. The 
statement requires governmental entities to report investments at fair value.  

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
  
 



LOS ALTOS HILLS COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT 
 
NOTES TO THE BASIC FINANCIAL STATEMENTS 
YEAR ENDED JUNE 30, 2017 
 

28 

NOTE 4. - FAIR VALUE MEASUREMENTS 
 
The District categorizes the fair value measurements of its investments based on the hierarchy established by 
generally accepted accounting principles. The fair value hierarchy, which has three levels, is based on the 
valuation inputs used to measure an asset's fair value.  The following provides a summary of the hierarchy used to 
measure fair value: 
 

Level 1 - Quoted prices in active markets for identical assets that the District has the ability to access at the 
measurement date. Level 1 assets may include debt and equity securities that are traded in an active exchange 
market and that are highly liquid and are actively traded in over-the-counter markets. 
  
Level 2 - Observable inputs other than Level 1 prices such as quoted prices for similar assets in active 
markets, quoted prices for identical or similar assets in markets that are not active, or other inputs that are 
observable, such as interest rates and curves observable at commonly quoted intervals, implied volatilities, 
and credit spreads. For financial reporting purposes, if an asset has a specified term, a Level 2 input is 
required to be observable for substantially the full term of the asset.  
 
Level 3 - Unobservable inputs should be developed using the best information available under the 
circumstances, which might include the District's own data. The District should adjust that data if reasonable 
available information indicates that other market participants would use different data or certain 
circumstances specific to the District are not available to other market participants.  

 
Uncategorized - Investments in the County Treasury Investment Pool are not categorized using the levels above 
because the District's transactions are based on a stable net asset value per share. All contributions and 
redemptions are transacted at $1.00 net asset value per share. 
 
The District's fair value measurements are as follows at June 30, 2017: 
 
 

Investment Type
Fair Value/

Uncategorized
County Pool 13,127,220$       

 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



LOS ALTOS HILLS COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT 
 
NOTES TO THE BASIC FINANCIAL STATEMENTS 
YEAR ENDED JUNE 30, 2017 
 

29 

 
NOTE 5. - CAPITAL ASSETS 
 

The capital asset activity for the year ended June 30, 2017 is as follows: 
 

Balance Balance
6/30/2016 Additions Deletions 6/30/2017

Governmental Activities:
Land 4,688$           -$                   -$                   4,688$           
Improvements 2,552,838      -                     -                     2,552,838      
Fire hydrants 1,078,745      -                     -                     1,078,745      
Furniture & equipment 63,118           -                     -                     63,118           

Total cost 3,699,389      -                     -                     3,699,389      
Accumulated depreciation (1,370,047)     (75,705)          -                     (1,445,752)     

Total Capital Assets, Net 2,329,342$    (75,705)$        -$                   2,253,637$    
 

 
Capital project expenditures for the year ended June 30, 2017 amounted to $1,301,771. The amount 
represents engineering and construction costs for upgrading hydrants, for which the ongoing maintenance 
and operations are the responsibility of Purissima Hills Water District and as such are not required under 
current accounting standards to be capitalized. 
 
For the year ended June 30, 2017, depreciation expense charged to public protection under 
governmental activities was $75,705. 
 

 
NOTE 6. - LEASE - FOOTHILL COMMUNITY COLLEGE 
 

The District leases the land for the newly constructed fire station situated on the Foothill Community 
College Campus, under the terms of a 99-year lease, at a rental of $1 per year (prepaid), expiring 
February 2092. 
 

 
NOTE 7. - CONTRACT FIRE PROTECTION SERVICES 
 

Santa Clara County Central Fire Protection District ("Central Fire District") 
 
On December 17, 1996, an agreement was reached between the City of Los Altos (the "City"), the 
District, and the Central Fire District, for Central Fire District to render fire protection and other services 
to all of the areas included within the territorial limits of the District. 

 



LOS ALTOS HILLS COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT 
 
NOTES TO THE BASIC FINANCIAL STATEMENTS 
YEAR ENDED JUNE 30, 2017 
 

30 

NOTE 7. - CONTRACT FIRE PROTECTION SERVICES (Continued) 
 

Term: The term of the agreement is for ten years from January 1, 1997 (although the effective date of 
commencement of services was 12:01 a.m. on December 30, 1996). The agreement provides for the 
automatic renewal for an additional ten-year period unless the City, the District, or Central Fire District 
provides written notice of non-renewal to the other parties at least 180 days prior to the expiration date of this 
agreement. As of March 2006, the District renewed the contract with Central Fire District under a new 
amendment for an additional ten-year period.  As of January 2017, the District amended and entered into a 
new agreement for an additional ten-year period, effective until December 31, 2026. 
 
Real Property and Equipment: The Central Fire District is authorized to occupy and use the City’s and the 
District's real property at no cost, and is responsible for maintaining and repairing the property should it be 
destroyed or damaged beyond repair, or otherwise rendered temporarily unusable. Until the destroyed or 
damaged portions are fully and permanently rebuilt or replaced, Central Fire District shall provide reasonable 
temporary facilities. The City and District shall remain responsible for the maintenance, repairs and/or 
replacement of fuel tanks at their respective stations. Title to any improvements and fixtures shall vest in the 
City and the District. In the event of termination of this agreement, Central Fire District will be reimbursed 
for any mutually agreed upon improvements, less straight-line depreciation over ten years of the purchase 
price, less the salvage value. 
 
The City transferred title to its equipment and rolling stock to Central Fire District. Upon termination of the 
agreement, the City and the District shall have the option of repurchasing any and all equipment previously 
sold to Central Fire District. If Central Fire District no longer owns that same equipment, City and the 
District shall have the option of purchasing comparable or replacement equipment from Central Fire District. 
In both events, the price will be the sales price, plus the value of any upgrades or additional features, less any 
depreciation value. The Central Fire District will be responsible for providing and replacing new equipment 
at no cost to the City and the District. 
 
Compensation: The Central Fire District will invoice the City and the District monthly, and payments 
shall be made within 15 days of receipt of the invoice. Payment is made by automatic transfer through 
the County of Santa Clara. 
 
Each calendar year commencing on January 1, 2017, and each January thereafter the City and the District 
shall owe to County Fire the annual operating costs in the amount of $10,627,038 jointly, subject to 
deductions of providing paramedic first responder service at a prorated basis, plus an increase to be 
determined as follows: 

 
A. The parties agree that annual increases in compensation to the Central Fire District for fire and 

emergency medical services costs shall be limited to the “weighted average” of the percent 
growth of the following three indices: 

 
(1) 50% Consumer Price Index defined as the second most prior February to the February 

immediately prior to the January being considered for increase, San Francisco-Oakland-
San Jose, All Urban, All Items Consumer Price Index, 

(2) 25% Assessed Valuation defined as the total Local Secured Values for the total parcels in 
the City or District as reported by the County of Santa Clara Controller’s Office each July; 
and 

(3) 25% COLA following a calculation formula – the average annual cost of living increase 
in total compensation provided to firefighters of the Central Fire District. 



LOS ALTOS HILLS COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT 
 
NOTES TO THE BASIC FINANCIAL STATEMENTS 
YEAR ENDED JUNE 30, 2017 
 

31 

NOTE 7. - CONTRACT FIRE PROTECTION SERVICES (Continued) 
 

B. If any index referenced in this Section has a negative growth, the value of the index (indices) 
will be zero for the purposes of computing the weighted average for that fiscal year. If all 
three indices have negative growth, the percent increase will be zero. At no time will the 
annual base amount be reduced as a result of the formula described in this Section. 

 
C. The annual weighted average increase shall not be less than 2% or greater than 5% in the base 
rate. 

 
The District has also entered into contracts with Central Fire District for a CERT Program Coordinator, 
at an annual base amount of $70,992 plus the adjustment as described in Part A above; a Battalion 
Chief, at an annual base amount of $1,103,355 plus the adjustment as described in Part A above; 
additional fire-season staffing at a rate of 1.5 times top step for Captain and each Firefighter/Engineer; 
and, beginning in July 2017, the use of a Wildland Interface Engine at the published OES rate for each 
day the engine is in service. 

 
Actual amounts paid by the District were as follows: 
 

2017 $5,741,943
2016 5,652,869
2015 5,429,903
2014 5,312,413
2013 5,107,403

For the fiscal year ended June 30,

 
 
In addition to the above services, the District will purchase, on occasion, emergency equipment with 
titles typically reverting to Santa Clara County Fire Department. 

 
 
NOTE 8. - OTHER CONTRACTED SERVICES 
 

A. Consulting Services 
 

Stuart Farwell has been a Fire Consultant to the District since July 1997. His latest agreement was 
approved on March 18, 2014. Mr. Farwell assists with all of the water main and hydrant projects in the 
District as well as overseeing the brush chipping program and other programs as directed by the Board. 
 
Jeanne Evilsizer has been the District Clerk since January 1981. The latest consulting agreement with the 
District was entered into on March 21, 2017. Her services include preparing the monthly packets, 
preparing the monthly invoices and taking the minutes of the monthly meetings. She also performs 
various other clerical duties. 



LOS ALTOS HILLS COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT 
 
NOTES TO THE BASIC FINANCIAL STATEMENTS 
YEAR ENDED JUNE 30, 2017 
 

32 

NOTE 8. - OTHER CONTRACTED SERVICES (Continued) 
 

Cori Vargas is the District’s Financial Consultant with the firm Vargas Company in San Jose. 
 
Dan Siegel is the District's Legal Counsel with the firm Jorgenson, Siegel, McClure and Flegel in Menlo 
Park. 

 
B. S.P. McClenahan, Co. Inc. 

 
The District contracts with S.P. McClenahan Co., Inc. for on-site "chipping" and tree removal services for 
District residents. The District's total costs for this vendor in fiscal year 2016-2017 amounted to about 
$1,252,181. 

 
C. Stoloski & Gonzalez, Inc. 
 
The District contracts with Stoloski & Gonzalez, Inc. for construction on Phase 8 of the Purissima Hills 
Fire Hydrant Replacement Project.  The District's total costs for this vendor in fiscal year 2016-2017 
amounted to about $1,035,205. 
 

 D.   Pakpour Consulting Group, Inc.  
 
 The District contracts with Pakpour Consulting Group, Inc. for engineering and construction management of 
 the Hydrant Replacement Project, and RFP coordination for the Tree Removal and Pruning Program.   The 
 District's total costs for this vendor in fiscal year 2016-2017 amounted to about $319,297. 
 
 E.  Kevin Kielty Arborist Services 

 
Kevin Kielty Arborist Services is contracted provide a count and analyzation of the District’s trees in 
preparation of the RFP process for the Tree Removal and Pruning Program.  The District's total costs for 
this vendor in fiscal year 2016-2017 amounted to $58,250. 
 
D. Green Waste Recovery 

 
In October 2008, the District began using the services of Green Waste Recovery for the Yard Waste Program 
at Foothill College. This free program allows residents to reduce fuel loads on their property and dispose of 
the cuttings monthly at Foothill College. The District's costs for year 2016-2017 amounted to about $37,332, 
which was paid to the Town of Los Altos Hills. 



 

33 

REQUIRED SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION 



LOS ALTOS HILLS COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT 
 
BUDGETARY COMPARISON SCHEDULE - GENERAL FUND 
YEAR ENDED JUNE 30, 2017 
 

34 

Original Final Actual
Budget Budget Amount

Budgetary Fund Balances,
Beginning of Year 11,217,240$  11,217,240$  11,164,565$  (52,675)$               
Resources (Inflows)

Property taxes 9,954,900      9,954,900      10,406,581 451,681                
Intergovernmental: State 46,000           46,000           45,222 (778)                      
Interest and investment income 45,000           45,000           99,372 54,372                  
Property rental 3,000             3,000             11,000 8,000                    
Other revenues 1,100             1,100             535                (565)                      

Amounts Available for Appropriation 10,050,000    10,050,000    10,562,710    512,710                

Charges to Appropriations (Outflows)
Public Protection

Services and supplies 8,318,431      8,318,431      7,570,205      748,226                
Capital outlay 2,005,570      2,005,570      1,301,771      703,799                

Total Charges to Appropriations 10,324,001    10,324,001    8,871,976      1,452,025             
Budgetary Fund Balances, End of 
Year 10,943,239$  10,943,239$  12,855,299$  1,912,060$           

Variance with
Final Budget 

Positive/(Negative)

 
 
 



   
 

35 
 

5000 Hopyard Road, Suite 335    Pleasanton, CA  94588    Tel: 925.734.6600    www.vtdcpa.com   Fax: 925.734.6611 

 
 

INDEPENDENT AUDITORS' REPORT ON INTERNAL CONTROL OVER 
FINANCIAL REPORTING AND ON COMPLIANCE AND OTHER MATTERS 

BASED ON AN AUDIT OF FINANCIAL STATEMENTS PERFORMED IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH GOVERNMENT AUDITING STANDARDS 

 
 
To the Board of Commissioners of Los Altos Hills 
County Fire District 
Los Altos, California 
 
 
We have audited, in accordance with auditing standards generally accepted in the United States of America and 
the standards applicable to financial audits contained in Government Auditing Standards issued by the 
Comptroller General of the United States, the financial statements of the governmental activities and the 
General fund of the Los Altos Hills County Fire District (the "District"), a component unit of the County of 
Santa Clara, as of and for the year ended June 30, 2017, and related notes to the financial statements, which 
collectively comprise the District's basic financial statements, and have issued our report thereon dated 
September 8, 2017.  
 
Internal Control Over Financial Reporting 
 
In planning and performing our audit of the financial statements, we considered Los Altos Hills County Fire 
District's internal control over financial reporting (internal control) to determine the audit procedures that are 
appropriate in the circumstances for the purpose of expressing our opinions on the financial statements, but not 
for the purpose of expressing an opinion on the effectiveness of the District's internal control. Accordingly, we 
do not express an opinion on the effectiveness of the District's internal control. 
 
A deficiency in internal control exists when the design or operation of a control does not allow management or 
employees, in the normal course of performing their assigned functions, to prevent, or detect and correct 
misstatements on a timely basis. A material weakness is a deficiency, or combination of deficiencies, in internal 
control, such that there is a reasonable possibility that a material misstatement of the entity's financial statements 
will not be prevented, or detected and corrected on a timely basis. A significant deficiency is a deficiency, or a 
combination of deficiencies, in internal control that is less severe than a material weakness, yet important enough 
to merit attention by those charged with governance. 
 
Our consideration of internal control was for the limited purpose described in the first paragraph of this section and 
was not designed to identify all deficiencies in internal control that might be material weaknesses or, significant 
deficiencies. Given these limitations, during our audit we did not identify any deficiencies in internal control that we 
consider to be material weaknesses. However, material weaknesses may exist that have not been identified. 
 



 

36 

Compliance and Other Matters 
 
As part of obtaining reasonable assurance about whether the District's financial statements are free from material 
misstatement, we performed tests of its compliance with certain provisions of laws, regulations, contracts, and grant 
agreements, noncompliance with which could have a direct and material effect on the determination of financial 
statement amounts. However, providing an opinion on compliance with those provisions was not an objective of our 
audit, and accordingly, we do not express such an opinion. The results of our tests disclosed no instances of 
noncompliance or other matters that are required to be reported under Government Auditing Standards. 
 
Purpose of this Report 
 
The purpose of this report is solely to describe the scope of our testing of internal control and compliance and the 
results of the testing, and not to provide an opinion on the effectiveness of the entity's internal control or on 
compliance. This report is an integral part of an audit performed in accordance with Government Auditing 
Standards in considering the entity's internal control and compliance. Accordingly, this communication is not 
suitable for any other purpose. 
 

 
 
Pleasanton, California 
September 8, 2017



LOS ALTOS HILLS COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT 
 
SUMMARY OF AUDITORS' RESULTS 
YEAR ENDED JUNE 30, 2017 
 

37 

Section I – Summary of Auditors' Results 
 
Financial Statements   
   
Types of auditors' report issued  Unmodified 
   
Internal Control over financial reporting   

• Material weakness identified?  No 
• Significant deficiency identified?  None reported 

Noncompliance material to financial statements noted?  No 
   
Federal Awards  Not applicable 
 
 
Section II – Financial Statement Findings 
 
Our audit of the accompanying basic financial statements of the Los Altos Hills County Fire District, as of and for the 
year ended June 30, 2017, disclosed no findings or questioned costs. 
 
Our report on the Los Altos Hills County Fire District's internal control over financial reporting and compliance and 
other matters based on an audit of basic financial statements performed in accordance with Government Auditing 
Standards, as of and for the year ended June 30, 2017, disclosed no findings or questioned costs. 

 
 
Section III – Federal Award Findings and Questioned Costs 
 
The Los Altos Hills County Fire District had no federal program as of and for the year ended June 30, 2017.



LOS ALTOS HILLS COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT 
 
SUMMARY SCHEDULE OF PRIOR AUDIT FINDINGS 
YEAR ENDED JUNE 30, 2017 

 

38 

Section I - Financial Statement Findings 
 
The audit of the basic financial statements of the Los Altos Hills County Fire District, as of and for the year ended 
June 30, 2016, disclosed no findings or questioned costs. 
 
The report on the Los Altos Hills County Fire District's internal control over financial reporting and compliance 
and other matters based on an audit of basic financial statements performed in accordance with Government 
Auditing Standards, as of and for the year ended June 30, 2016, disclosed no findings or questioned costs. 
 
 
Section II - Federal Award Findings and Questioned Costs 
 
The Los Altos Hills County Fire District had no federal program as of and for the year ended June 30, 2016. 















IN
TE

R
N
AT
IO

NA
LLY ACCREDITED

AG
EN

C
Y

2010-2015

14700 Winchester Blvd., Los Gatos, CA  95032-1818
(408) 378-4010   (408) 378-9342 (fax)   www.sccfd.org

FIRE DEPARTMENT
SANTA CLARA COUNTY

COURTESY & SERVICE

S
A
N
T

A
CL

ARA CO

U
N
T

FIRE

EST. 1947

August 9, 2017

Los Altos Hills County Fire District Commissioners 
12355 El Monte Road 
Los Altos Hills, CA 94022 

Subject: Fire Report for July 2017

To Whom It May Concern: 

The July 2017 fire reports for the Los Altos Hills County Fire District are enclosed:

1. Average Response Time Analysis:  This report provides data for the last three fiscal
years on the average time it took for each first-in unit to arrive on scene.  The
computation starts from the moment the dispatcher makes his/her first keystroke at the
command panel (after the call has been handed-off by the Emergency 911 telephone
handler).  This information is also graphically represented in the accompanying bar
charts.

The arrival times for first-due units on code three calls was 8 minutes or less for:

Freeway: 100%
Metro/Urban: 100%
Suburban: 91.67%
Rural: 71.43%

2. Incident Types by Month:  This report summarizes on a monthly basis, the number of
incidents by call type, for every emergency vehicle that was the first unit on-scene.  This
information is also graphically represented in a pie chart depicting the number of
incidents by type.

3. Monetary Fire Loss by Month and Incident Type: This report presents the monthly
dollar loss in each of the fire type categories for the last three calendar years. The fire
loss for the month was uniquely impacted by the $105,000 Estacada Drive fire.

The fire loss for this month was $105,000.

Please let me know if you have any questions about the data contained in this report. 

Sincerely, 

Tony Bowden 
Assistant Fire Chief 

Enclosures 

c: Steve Prziborowski, Deputy Chief 

TB:kr

1



Sources: Esri, HERE, DeLorme, Intermap, increment P Corp., GEBCO, USGS, FAO, NPS, NRCAN,
GeoBase, IGN, Kadaster NL, Ordnance Survey, Esri Japan, METI, Esri China (Hong Kong), swisstopo,
MapmyIndia, © OpenStreetMap contributors, and the GIS User Community

Los Altos Hills Fire Protection District
    Public Safety Report

Legend
Freeway
Rural
Suburban
Urban/Metro
Los Altos Hills FPD

2



FIRST	DUE 6 04:09.7 12 05:23.3 14 07:06.4 3 03:59.7 35 05:44.7
E75 5 06:29.0 5 06:29.0
E76 5 04:13.8 4 04:19.3 2 05:12.0 11 04:26.4
R74 1 03:49.0 3 04:59.0 11 07:10.1 2 05:59.5 17 06:26.8
B74 1 00:00.0 1 00:00.0
E374 1 10:15.0 1 10:15.0

RELIABILITY 2 06:39.5 2 05:10.0 4 09:18.0 8 07:36.4
E75 1 04:17.0 2 12:30.5 3 09:46.0
R74 1 06:22.0 1 06:22.0
E71 1 08:52.0 1 08:52.0
E377 1 03:19.0 1 03:19.0
E72 1 06:03.0 1 06:03.0
CFSAF 1 06:57.0 1 06:57.0

Grand	Total 8 04:47.1 14 05:21.4 18 07:35.7 3 03:59.7 43 06:05.5

FIRE 1 06:58.0 2 06:05.5 3 06:23.0
Structure 1 06:58.0 1 06:58.0
Vehicle
Vegetation 2 06:05.5 2 06:05.5
Outside	rubbish
Special	outside
Other

OVERPRESSURE
EMS 3 04:14.7 11 05:16.9 14 07:43.4 1 00:00.0 29 06:10.3
HAZ	CONDITIONS 1 04:41.0 1 04:41.0
SERVICE 1 03:49.0 1 04:59.0 2 04:24.0
GOOD	INTENT 3 05:56.3 1 04:56.0 1 11:42.0 2 05:59.5 7 06:38.0
FALSE	ALARM 1 03:55.0 1 03:55.0
SEVERE	WEATHER
TOTAL 8 04:47.1 14 05:21.4 18 07:35.7 3 03:59.7 43 06:05.5

Los	Altos	Hills	County	Fire	District	First	Arriving	Unit	Average	Response	Times

Code	3	Calls	Only

July	2017

All	Call	Types

METRO/URBAN SUBURBAN RURAL FREEWAY TOTAL

#	Responses Average	
Response	Time

#	Responses Average	
Response	Time

METRO/URBAN SUBURBAN RURAL FREEWAY

Call	Type	Breakdown

#	Responses Average	
Response	Time

#	Responses Average	
Response	Time

#	Responses Average	
Response	Time

Average	
Response	Time

TOTAL

#	Responses Average	
Response	Time

#	Responses Average	
Response	Time

#	Responses Average	
Response	Time

#	Responses Average	
Response	Time

#	Responses

3



30

19 21

29

22 20 18

11

14 12

11

12 14
14

28

11 8

6

4
8

6

9
6

8

7

11

3

05:12.2

05:56.5

06:27.2

06:00.2 05:59.2
05:38.6

06:05.5

00:00.0

01:26.4

02:52.8

04:19.2

05:45.6

07:12.0

0

10

20

30

40

50

60

70

80

Jan 
(75) 

Feb 
(53) 

Mar 
(47) 

Apr 
(54) 

May 
(45) 

Jun 
(53) 

Jul 
(43) 

Aug Sep Oct Nov Dec

2017

Los	Altos	Hills	County	Fire	District	Response	Counts	&	Average	Times
Code	3	Only

FREEWAY

METRO/URBAN

SUBURBAN

RURAL

Avg	Response	Time

4



23 17 21 21 15 22 27 20 23 28 16 19

9

13

8 7

8

10

9

18

13

10

9

10

4
2

5
2

6

10

5
2

10
4

28

6

4

8
8

5
4

10

3
4

9

6

1

4

05:51.7 05:50.8 05:52.3

05:19.9
05:37.3

05:12.3

05:34.6
05:09.9

05:23.0

05:11.8

04:18.8

06:01.7

00:00.0

01:26.4

02:52.8

04:19.2

05:45.6

07:12.0

0

10

20

30

40

50

60

Jan
(40)

Feb
(40)

Mar
(42)

Apr
(35)

May
(33)

Jun
(52)

Jul
(43)

Aug
(44)

Sep
(55)

Oct
(48)

Nov
(54)

Dec
(39)

2016

Los	Altos	Hills	County	Fire	District	Response	Counts	&	Average	Times
Code	3	Only

FREEWAY

METRO/URBAN

SUBURBAN

RURAL

Avg	Response	Time

5



28 16 19 14 24 19 25 20 17 26 22 21

11

12

12

13

12

17
9

11

8

11
16

8

2

1

3

6

9 8
4

4

2

4
10

6

6

5

4
1

4
3

7

6

8

4

5

05:57.1 05:56.0 05:52.2

05:24.9

04:53.7

05:54.2 05:58.1 05:56.4

05:35.8

06:27.0

05:35.4

05:51.1

00:00.0

01:26.4

02:52.8

04:19.2

05:45.6

07:12.0

0

10

20

30

40

50

60

Jan
(47)

Feb
(34)

Mar
(38)

Apr
(34)

May
(49)

Jun
(47)

Jul
(45)

Aug
(41)

Sep
(27)

Oct
(49)

Nov
(52)

Dec
(40)

2015

Los	Altos	Hills	County	Fire	District	Response	Counts	&	Average	Times
Code	3	Only

FREEWAY

METRO/URBAN

SUBURBAN

RURAL

Avg	Response	Time

6



First	Unit	Arrived	In	Less	Than 1	min 2	min 3	min 4	min 5	min 6	min 7	min 8	min 9	min 10	min

FIRST	DUE	(35) 2.86%	(1) 2.86%	(1) 2.86%	(1) 17.14%	(6) 42.86%	(15) 62.86%	(22) 80%	(28) 85.71%	(30) 91.43%	(32) 94.29%	(33)

URBAN/METRO	(6) 66.67%	(4) 83.33%	(5) 100%	(6) 100%	(6) 100%	(6) 100%	(6) 100%	(6)

E76	(5) 60%	(3) 80%	(4) 100%	(5) 100%	(5) 100%	(5) 100%	(5) 100%	(5)
R74	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1)

SUBURBAN	(12) 8.33%	(1) 50%	(6) 75%	(9) 91.67%	(11) 91.67%	(11) 100%	(12) 100%	(12)

E75	(5) 20%	(1) 40%	(2) 80%	(4) 80%	(4) 100%	(5) 100%	(5)
E76	(4) 25%	(1) 75%	(3) 100%	(4) 100%	(4) 100%	(4) 100%	(4) 100%	(4)
R74	(3) 66.67%	(2) 100%	(3) 100%	(3) 100%	(3) 100%	(3) 100%	(3)

RURAL	(14) 21.43%	(3) 35.71%	(5) 57.14%	(8) 71.43%	(10) 78.57%	(11) 85.71%	(12)

E76	(2) 50%	(1) 100%	(2) 100%	(2) 100%	(2) 100%	(2) 100%	(2)
R74	(11) 18.18%	(2) 27.27%	(3) 54.55%	(6) 72.73%	(8) 81.82%	(9) 90.91%	(10)
E374	(1) 0%	(0) 0%	(0) 0%	(0)

FREEWAY	(3) 33.33%	(1) 33.33%	(1) 33.33%	(1) 33.33%	(1) 33.33%	(1) 66.67%	(2) 100%	(3) 100%	(3) 100%	(3) 100%	(3)

R74	(2) 50%	(1) 100%	(2) 100%	(2) 100%	(2) 100%	(2)
B74	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1)

RELIABILITY	(8) 12.5%	(1) 25%	(2) 25%	(2) 62.5%	(5) 62.5%	(5) 75%	(6) 75%	(6)

RURAL	(4) 25%	(1) 25%	(1) 25%	(1) 25%	(1) 25%	(1) 50%	(2) 50%	(2)

E75	(2) 0%	(0) 0%	(0) 0%	(0)
E71	(1) 0%	(0) 100%	(1) 100%	(1)
E377	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1)

SUBURBAN	(2) 50%	(1) 50%	(1) 100%	(2) 100%	(2) 100%	(2) 100%	(2)

E75	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1)
E72	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1)

URBAN/METRO	(2) 100%	(2) 100%	(2) 100%	(2) 100%	(2)

R74	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1)
CFSAF	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1)

Grand	Total	(43) 2.33%	(1) 2.33%	(1) 2.33%	(1) 16.28%	(7) 39.53%	(17) 55.81%	(24) 76.74%	(33) 81.4%	(35) 88.37%	(38) 90.7%	(39)

#	of	Calls
1
0
0
6
10
7
9
2
3
1
4>	10:00 100.00%

7:00	-	7:59 81.40%
8:00	-	8:59 88.37%
9:00	-	9:59 90.70%

4:00	-	4:59 39.53%
5:00	-	5:59 55.81%
6:00	-	6:59 76.74%

0:00	-	0:59 2.33%

2:00	-	2:59 2.33%
3:00	-	3:59 16.28%

1:00	-	1:59 2.33%

Los	Altos	Hills	County	Fire	District	First	Arriving	Unit	Response	Time	Centiles

Code	3	Calls	Only

July	2017

Occurred	in	Range Cumulative	%

7



0% 

10% 

20% 

30% 

40% 

50% 

60% 

70% 

80% 

90% 

100% 

0

2

4

6

8

10

12

0:00 - 0:59 1:00 - 1:59 2:00	- 2:59 3:00 - 3:59 4:00 - 4:59 5:00 - 5:59 6:00 - 6:59 7:00 - 7:59 8:00 - 8:59 9:00 - 9:59 >	10:00

Cu
m
ul
at
iv
e	
%

#	
of
	C
al
ls

Occurred	in	Range	(min)

Los	Altos	Hills	County	Fire	District	Response	Time	Centiles
Code	3	Only

8



Jan Feb Mar Apr May Jun Jul Aug Sep Oct Nov Dec Total

2017 1 1 1 2 0 4 4 13
2016 0 0 0 2 0 3 0 0 2 1 1 2 11
2015 2 2 0 4 0 3 3 1 2 2 0 2 21

2017 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
2016 0 0 1 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 2
2015 0 1 0 0 0 1 0 0 1 0 0 0 3

2017 67 38 42 38 34 32 36 287
2016 39 30 35 38 31 40 34 41 37 36 48 42 451
2015 39 33 39 30 57 41 39 31 22 53 48 33 465

2017 6 3 1 9 0 3 1 23
2016 4 5 0 5 4 2 0 0 1 3 5 6 35
2015 5 5 1 0 2 2 1 1 1 2 3 3 26

2017 9 9 1 12 6 10 10 57
2016 9 5 8 6 2 4 14 2 7 11 8 7 83
2015 4 11 8 11 8 7 7 6 5 7 7 7 88

2017 8 15 18 24 8 17 20 110
2016 8 12 14 9 8 17 16 8 13 14 6 4 129
2015 13 11 6 6 12 9 11 12 17 11 15 7 130

2017 4 8 9 8 13 8 10 60
2016 13 8 4 4 4 9 13 10 14 8 7 5 99
2015 10 4 6 7 6 15 9 13 14 8 9 12 113

2017 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 1
2016 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
2015 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

2017 95 74 72 93 61 75 81 0 0 0 0 0 551
2016 73 60 62 65 49 75 77 61 74 73 75 66 810
2015 73 67 60 58 85 78 70 64 62 83 82 64 846

Total

Fire

Overpressure,	Rupture,	
Explosion,	Overheat	
(No	Fire)

Rescue	&	Emergency	
Medical	Service

Los	Altos	Hills	County	Fire	District	Incidents	by	Month

All	Code	Calls

2017,	2016,	&	2015

Hazardous	Condition

Service	Call

Good	Intent	Call

False	Alarm	&	False	Call

Special	Incident

9



	



Jan Feb Mar Apr May Jun Jul Aug Sep Oct Nov Dec Total

2017 $6,500 $0 $0 $3,000 $0 $0 $105,000 $114,500
2016 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $350,000 $0 $2,000 $45 $50,000 $100 $402,145
2015 $16,500 $100,000 $0 $60,000 $0 $0 $2,000 $0 $0 $20,000 $0 $5,500 $204,000

2017 $0 $0 $0 $3,000 $0 $0 $0 $3,000
2016 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $4,000 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $13,000 $17,000
2015 $0 $1,000 $0 $4,000 $0 $2,000 $1,700 $2,500 $15,250 $0 $0 $1,750 $28,200

2017 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0
2016 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0
2015 $0 $0 $0 $50 $0 $100 $5,000 $0 $100 $0 $0 $0 $5,250

2017 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0
2016 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0
2015 $0 $0 $0 $50 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $50

2017 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0
2016 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0
2015 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0

2017 $6,500 $0 $0 $6,000 $0 $0 $105,000 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $117,500
2016 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $4,000 $350,000 $0 $2,000 $45 $50,000 $13,100 $419,145
2015 $16,500 $101,000 $0 $64,100 $0 $2,100 $8,700 $2,500 $15,350 $20,000 $0 $7,250 $237,500

Outside	Rubbish	/	
Dumpster

Special	Outside	Fire

Total	Fire	Loss

Los	Altos	Hills	County	Fire	District	Monetary	Loss	by	Month	&	Incident	Type

Only	Fires

2017,	2016,	&	2015

Structure	Fire

Vehicle	Fire

Natural	Vegetation	Fire

11



IN
TE

R
N
AT
IO

NA
LLY ACCREDITED

AG
EN

C
Y

2010-2015

14700 Winchester Blvd., Los Gatos, CA  95032-1818
(408) 378-4010   (408) 378-9342 (fax)   www.sccfd.org

FIRE DEPARTMENT
SANTA CLARA COUNTY

COURTESY & SERVICE

S
A
N
T

A
CL

ARA CO

U
N
T

FIRE

EST. 1947

September 7, 2017

Los Altos Hills County Fire District Commissioners 
12355 El Monte Road 
Los Altos Hills, CA 94022 

Subject: Fire Report for August 2017

To Whom It May Concern: 

The August 2017 fire reports for the Los Altos Hills County Fire District are enclosed:

1. Average Response Time Analysis:  This report provides data for the last three fiscal
years on the average time it took for each first-in unit to arrive on scene.  The
computation starts from the moment the dispatcher makes his/her first keystroke at the
command panel (after the call has been handed-off by the Emergency 911 telephone
handler).  This information is also graphically represented in the accompanying bar
charts.

The arrival times for first-due units on code three calls was 8 minutes or less for:

Freeway: 100%
Metro/Urban: 100%
Suburban: 100%
Rural: 62.5%

2. Incident Types by Month:  This report summarizes on a monthly basis, the number of
incidents by call type, for every emergency vehicle that was the first unit on-scene.  This
information is also graphically represented in a pie chart depicting the number of
incidents by type.

3. Monetary Fire Loss by Month and Incident Type: This report presents the monthly
dollar loss in each of the fire type categories for the last three calendar years.

The fire loss for this month was $4,500.

Please let me know if you have any questions about the data contained in this report. 

Sincerely, 

Tony Bowden

Assistant Fire Chief

Enclosures 

c: Steve Prziborowski, Deputy Chief

TB:kr

1



Sources: Esri, HERE, DeLorme, Intermap, increment P Corp., GEBCO, USGS, FAO, NPS, NRCAN,
GeoBase, IGN, Kadaster NL, Ordnance Survey, Esri Japan, METI, Esri China (Hong Kong), swisstopo,
MapmyIndia, © OpenStreetMap contributors, and the GIS User Community

Los Altos Hills Fire Protection District
    Public Safety Report

Legend
Freeway
Rural
Suburban
Urban/Metro
Los Altos Hills FPD

2



FIRST	DUE 7 04:39.7 8 04:08.9 16 06:56.0 2 04:54.5 33 05:39.2
E75 2 04:53.0 2 04:53.0
E76 4 04:39.7 4 07:41.7 1 05:51.0 9 06:08.6
R74 3 04:39.7 6 03:54.2 10 07:19.1 1 03:58.0 20 05:43.7
B74 1 03:59.0 1 03:59.0
E374 1 02:59.0 1 02:59.0

RELIABILITY 3 06:40.0 1 02:38.0 3 06:23.3 7 05:58.3
E76 1 06:43.0 1 06:43.0
R74 2 06:39.0 1 04:29.0 3 05:55.7
E71 1 06:42.0 1 06:42.0
E72 1 07:58.0 1 07:58.0
CFSAF 1 02:38.0 1 02:38.0

Grand	Total 10 05:15.8 8 04:08.9 17 06:40.8 5 05:47.8 40 05:42.5

FIRE 2 05:27.5 2 05:27.5
Structure 1 06:56.0 1 06:56.0
Vehicle 1 03:59.0 1 03:59.0
Vegetation
Outside	rubbish
Special	outside
Other

OVERPRESSURE
EMS 5 04:52.6 7 03:59.9 9 07:37.0 1 03:58.0 22 05:40.6
HAZ	CONDITIONS 1 06:52.0 1 06:58.0 2 06:55.0
SERVICE 1 06:42.0 2 07:32.5 4 06:15.2 7 06:41.1
GOOD	INTENT 3 04:53.7 1 05:12.0 3 04:01.0 7 04:33.7
FALSE	ALARM
SEVERE	WEATHER
TOTAL 10 05:15.8 8 04:08.9 17 06:40.8 5 05:47.8 40 05:42.5

Average	
Response	Time

TOTAL

#	Responses Average	
Response	Time

#	Responses Average	
Response	Time

#	Responses Average	
Response	Time

#	Responses Average	
Response	Time

#	Responses

Call	Type	Breakdown

#	Responses Average	
Response	Time

#	Responses Average	
Response	Time

#	Responses Average	
Response	Time

METRO/URBAN SUBURBAN RURAL FREEWAY

Los	Altos	Hills	County	Fire	District	First	Arriving	Unit	Average	Response	Times

Code	3	Calls	Only

August	2017

All	Call	Types

METRO/URBAN SUBURBAN RURAL FREEWAY TOTAL

#	Responses Average	
Response	Time

#	Responses Average	
Response	Time

3



30

19 21

29

22 20 18 17

11

14 12

11

12 14
14

8

28

11 8

6

4
8

10

6

9
6

8

7

11

3

5

05:12.2

05:56.5

06:27.2

06:00.2 05:59.2
05:38.6

06:05.5

05:42.5

00:00.0

01:26.4

02:52.8

04:19.2

05:45.6

07:12.0

0

10

20

30

40

50

60

70

80

Jan 
(75) 

Feb 
(53) 

Mar 
(47) 

Apr 
(54) 

May 
(45) 

Jun 
(53) 

Jul 
(43) 

Aug 
(40) 

Sep Oct Nov Dec

2017

Los	Altos	Hills	County	Fire	District	Response	Counts	&	Average	Times
Code	3	Only

FREEWAY

METRO/URBAN

SUBURBAN

RURAL

Avg	Response	Time

4



23 17 21 21 15 22 27 20 23 28 16 19

9

13

8 7

8

10

9

18

13

10

9

10

4
2

5
2

6

10

5
2

10
4

28

6

4

8
8

5
4

10

3
4

9

6

1

4

05:51.7 05:50.8 05:52.3

05:19.9
05:37.3

05:12.3

05:34.6
05:09.9

05:23.0

05:11.8

04:18.8

06:01.7

00:00.0

01:26.4

02:52.8

04:19.2

05:45.6

07:12.0

0

10

20

30

40

50

60

Jan
(40)

Feb
(40)

Mar
(42)

Apr
(35)

May
(33)

Jun
(52)

Jul
(43)

Aug
(44)

Sep
(55)

Oct
(48)

Nov
(54)

Dec
(39)

2016

Los	Altos	Hills	County	Fire	District	Response	Counts	&	Average	Times
Code	3	Only

FREEWAY

METRO/URBAN

SUBURBAN

RURAL

Avg	Response	Time

5



28 16 19 14 24 19 25 20 17 26 22 21

11

12

12

13

12

17
9

11

8

11
16

8

2

1

3

6

9 8
4

4

2

4
10

6

6

5

4
1

4
3

7

6

8

4

5

05:57.1 05:56.0 05:52.2

05:24.9

04:53.7

05:54.2 05:58.1 05:56.4

05:35.8

06:27.0

05:35.4

05:51.1

00:00.0

01:26.4

02:52.8

04:19.2

05:45.6

07:12.0

0

10

20

30

40

50

60

Jan
(47)

Feb
(34)

Mar
(38)

Apr
(34)

May
(49)

Jun
(47)

Jul
(45)

Aug
(41)

Sep
(27)

Oct
(49)

Nov
(52)

Dec
(40)

2015

Los	Altos	Hills	County	Fire	District	Response	Counts	&	Average	Times
Code	3	Only

FREEWAY

METRO/URBAN

SUBURBAN

RURAL

Avg	Response	Time

6



First	Unit	Arrived	In	Less	Than 1	min 2	min 3	min 4	min 5	min 6	min 7	min 8	min 9	min 10	min

FIRST	DUE	(33) 3.03%	(1) 6.06%	(2) 15.15%	(5) 36.36%	(12) 45.45%	(15) 69.7%	(23) 75.76%	(25) 81.82%	(27) 81.82%	(27) 84.85%	(28)

URBAN/METRO	(7) 14.29%	(1) 57.14%	(4) 100%	(7) 100%	(7) 100%	(7) 100%	(7) 100%	(7)

E76	(4) 75%	(3) 100%	(4) 100%	(4) 100%	(4) 100%	(4) 100%	(4)
R74	(3) 33.33%	(1) 33.33%	(1) 100%	(3) 100%	(3) 100%	(3) 100%	(3) 100%	(3)

SUBURBAN	(8) 12.5%	(1) 12.5%	(1) 62.5%	(5) 62.5%	(5) 100%	(8) 100%	(8) 100%	(8) 100%	(8) 100%	(8)

E75	(2) 50%	(1) 50%	(1) 100%	(2) 100%	(2) 100%	(2) 100%	(2) 100%	(2)
R74	(6) 16.67%	(1) 16.67%	(1) 66.67%	(4) 66.67%	(4) 100%	(6) 100%	(6) 100%	(6) 100%	(6) 100%	(6)

RURAL	(16) 6.25%	(1) 6.25%	(1) 25%	(4) 31.25%	(5) 31.25%	(5) 37.5%	(6) 50%	(8) 62.5%	(10) 62.5%	(10) 68.75%	(11)

E76	(4) 25%	(1) 50%	(2) 75%	(3) 75%	(3) 75%	(3)
R74	(10) 10%	(1) 10%	(1) 30%	(3) 30%	(3) 30%	(3) 30%	(3) 40%	(4) 50%	(5) 50%	(5) 60%	(6)
B74	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1)
E374	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1)

FREEWAY	(2) 50%	(1) 50%	(1) 100%	(2) 100%	(2) 100%	(2) 100%	(2) 100%	(2)

E76	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1)
R74	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1)

RELIABILITY	(7) 14.29%	(1) 14.29%	(1) 28.57%	(2) 28.57%	(2) 85.71%	(6) 100%	(7) 100%	(7) 100%	(7)

RURAL	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1)

CFSAF	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1)

FREEWAY	(3) 33.33%	(1) 33.33%	(1) 66.67%	(2) 100%	(3) 100%	(3) 100%	(3)

E76	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1)
R74	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1)
E72	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1)

URBAN/METRO	(3) 100%	(3) 100%	(3) 100%	(3) 100%	(3)

R74	(2) 100%	(2) 100%	(2) 100%	(2) 100%	(2)
E71	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1) 100%	(1)

Grand	Total	(40) 2.5%	(1) 5%	(2) 15%	(6) 32.5%	(13) 42.5%	(17) 62.5%	(25) 77.5%	(31) 85%	(34) 85%	(34) 87.5%	(35)

#	of	Calls
1
1
4
7
4
8
6
3
0
1
5

Los	Altos	Hills	County	Fire	District	First	Arriving	Unit	Response	Time	Centiles

Code	3	Calls	Only

August	2017

Occurred	in	Range Cumulative	%
0:00	-	0:59 2.50%

2:00	-	2:59 15.00%
3:00	-	3:59 32.50%

1:00	-	1:59 5.00%

4:00	-	4:59 42.50%
5:00	-	5:59 62.50%
6:00	-	6:59 77.50%

>	10:00 100.00%

7:00	-	7:59 85.00%
8:00	-	8:59 85.00%
9:00	-	9:59 87.50%

7



0% 

10% 

20% 

30% 

40% 

50% 

60% 

70% 

80% 

90% 

100% 

0

1

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

0:00 - 0:59 1:00 - 1:59 2:00	- 2:59 3:00 - 3:59 4:00 - 4:59 5:00 - 5:59 6:00 - 6:59 7:00 - 7:59 8:00 - 8:59 9:00 - 9:59 >	10:00

Cu
m
ul
at
iv
e	
%

#	
of
	C
al
ls

Occurred	in	Range	(min)

Los	Altos	Hills	County	Fire	District	Response	Time	Centiles
Code	3	Only

8



Jan Feb Mar Apr May Jun Jul Aug Sep Oct Nov Dec Total

2017 1 1 1 2 0 4 4 2 15
2016 0 0 0 2 0 3 0 0 2 1 1 2 11
2015 2 2 0 4 0 3 3 1 2 2 0 2 21

2017 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
2016 0 0 1 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 2
2015 0 1 0 0 0 1 0 0 1 0 0 0 3

2017 67 38 42 38 34 32 36 31 318
2016 39 30 35 38 31 40 34 41 37 36 48 42 451
2015 39 33 39 30 57 41 39 31 22 53 48 33 465

2017 6 3 1 9 0 3 1 3 26
2016 4 5 0 5 4 2 0 0 1 3 5 6 35
2015 5 5 1 0 2 2 1 1 1 2 3 3 26

2017 9 9 1 12 6 10 10 10 67
2016 9 5 8 6 2 4 14 2 7 11 8 7 83
2015 4 11 8 11 8 7 7 6 5 7 7 7 88

2017 8 15 18 24 8 17 20 18 128
2016 8 12 14 9 8 17 16 8 13 14 6 4 129
2015 13 11 6 6 12 9 11 12 17 11 15 7 130

2017 4 8 9 8 13 8 10 13 73
2016 13 8 4 4 4 9 13 10 14 8 7 5 99
2015 10 4 6 7 6 15 9 13 14 8 9 12 113

2017 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 1
2016 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
2015 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

2017 95 74 72 93 61 75 81 77 0 0 0 0 628
2016 73 60 62 65 49 75 77 61 74 73 75 66 810
2015 73 67 60 58 85 78 70 64 62 83 82 64 846

Total

Fire

Overpressure,	Rupture,	
Explosion,	Overheat	
(No	Fire)

Rescue	&	Emergency	
Medical	Service

Los	Altos	Hills	County	Fire	District	Incidents	by	Month

All	Code	Calls

2017,	2016,	&	2015

Hazardous	Condition

Service	Call

Good	Intent	Call

False	Alarm	&	False	Call

Special	Incident

9



Fire

2.39% 

Rescue	&	Emergency	Medical	
Service
50.64%

Hazardous	Condition
4.14%

Service	Call
10.67%

Good	Intent	Call
20.38%

False	Alarm	&	False	Call
11.62%

Severe	Weather
0.16%

Los	Altos	Hills	County	Fire	District	Incident	Type	Breakdown
All	Code	Calls

2017

10



Jan Feb Mar Apr May Jun Jul Aug Sep Oct Nov Dec Total

2017 $6,500 $0 $0 $3,000 $0 $0 $105,000 $2,500 $117,000
2016 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $350,000 $0 $2,000 $45 $50,000 $100 $402,145
2015 $16,500 $100,000 $0 $60,000 $0 $0 $2,000 $0 $0 $20,000 $0 $5,500 $204,000

2017 $0 $0 $0 $3,000 $0 $0 $0 $2,000 $5,000
2016 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $4,000 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $13,000 $17,000
2015 $0 $1,000 $0 $4,000 $0 $2,000 $1,700 $2,500 $15,250 $0 $0 $1,750 $28,200

2017 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0
2016 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0
2015 $0 $0 $0 $50 $0 $100 $5,000 $0 $100 $0 $0 $0 $5,250

2017 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0
2016 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0
2015 $0 $0 $0 $50 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $50

2017 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0
2016 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0
2015 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0

2017 $6,500 $0 $0 $6,000 $0 $0 $105,000 $4,500 $0 $0 $0 $0 $122,000
2016 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $4,000 $350,000 $0 $2,000 $45 $50,000 $13,100 $419,145
2015 $16,500 $101,000 $0 $64,100 $0 $2,100 $8,700 $2,500 $15,350 $20,000 $0 $7,250 $237,500

Outside	Rubbish	/	
Dumpster

Special	Outside	Fire

Total	Fire	Loss

Los	Altos	Hills	County	Fire	District	Monetary	Loss	by	Month	&	Incident	Type

Only	Fires

2017,	2016,	&	2015

Structure	Fire

Vehicle	Fire

Natural	Vegetation	Fire

11





 

5776 Stoneridge Mall Road, Suite 320, Pleasanton, CA 94588 
(925) 224‐7717  FAX (925) 224‐7726  www.pcgengr.com 

MEMO 
 

Agency:  Los Altos Hills County Fire District  Date  September 8, 2017 

Attn:  Board of Commissioners       

Project Name:  Fire Hydrant Replacement Project – Phase VIII  Project No.  10003.19 

Reference: 
Project Update ‐ Progress Payment No. 6 and 
Notice of Acceptance 

 

 

From:  Joubin Pakpour, P.E.   – District Engineer JP   
 

 

         

 

Construction Status 
 

On July 13th a project walk through was held by Kurt Wurnitsch (Project Manager) of Pakpour Consulting 
Group (PCG) to review the project and prepare the final punch  list  items.   The Town of Los Altos Hills‐
Public Works Department  (Town) and Purissima Hills Water District  (PHWD) were  invited, but did not 
attend the walk through.  The Town did provide a few items to include with the final punch list for fire 
hydrants  (FH)  located along Taaffe Road only.   PHWD did not have any coordination  items  to  include 
with the final project punch list. 
 

The project was deemed substantially complete and in conformance with the plans and specifications on 
July 17th (Work Day No. 120 out of the original 120 working days established by the contract). 
 

The  original  contract  amount was  $1,141,710.00.    The  adjusted  final  contract  amount,  including  all 
change orders  and deductions  for bid  items not  constructed,  is $1,113,910.85.   The original  contract 
amount was reduced by <$27,799.15> primarily due to individual bid items not installed. 
 

As  of  August  31st  all work,  including  punch‐list  items  are  complete  in  accordance with  the  Contract 
Documents and all  fire hydrants are  in  service.   The  last day of work on  this project was August 31st.  
Therefore, we recommend acceptance of the project by the LAHCFD and filing a Notice of Completion 
(NOC) with Santa Clara County. 
 

Attached  is  the  updated  “Preliminary  Engineer’s Opinion  of  Probable  Construction  Cost  Estimate  for 
Budgeting Purposes Only” for the September report, which includes the following minor modifications: 

 Schedule extended to include September (FY 2017‐18) to capture project close‐out coordination 
efforts. 

 Sub‐Consultant (Geotech & Tree Arborist) original budget of $40,000 reduced by the estimated 
unused  amount  of  $30,154  ($40,000  less  $9,846  Actual)  and  included with  the  Construction 
Management  services  provided  by  PCG  for  project  close‐out  coordination  efforts  identified 
above. 

 Included added cost items for replacing existing FH (PHWD FH No. 16.01) at 26025 Duval Way. 
 



September 8, 2017 / Page 2 
Los Altos Hills County Fire District / Progress Payment No. 6 and Notice of Acceptance 

 

Change Order No. 3 
 

As  reported  in Progress Payment No. 5  the existing old dry‐barrel FH  (PHWD FH No. 16.01) at 26025 
Duval Way  identified to be replaced as part of PHWD’s future Capital Improvement Program (currently 
not scheduled) developed a leak and required replacement.  Change Order No. 3, with an increase in the 
amount of $16,231.60, includes the following additional work items: 

 Replace leaking existing FH assembly. 

 Replace existing non‐standard 1‐inch residential water service connection for 26044 Duval Way 
that  was mismarked  in  the  field  by  PHWD.    PCG  is  currently  working  with  PHWD  staff  to 
coordinate cost sharing reimbursement to LAHCFD for this unforeseen field condition. 

 

Please see Change Order No. 3 for a complete description of the above items. 
 

Balancing Change Order No. 3 
 

Enclosed please find the final Balancing Change Order No. 3 in the sum of <$44,872.00> for a deduction 
of material not used as part of this project.  Balancing Change Order No. 3 adjusts the original contract 
bid quantities to reflect the actually constructed quantities. 
 

Project Schedule and Request for Progress Payment No. 6 
 

Enclosed  please  find  Progress  Payment No.  6  due  Stoloski & Gonzalez,  Inc.  (SGI)  for  this  period  for 
$23,010.52  (value  of  work  minus  5  percent  retention).    The  work  performed  to  date  has  been 
satisfactory and payment is recommended. 
 

After the 30‐day lien period following the filling of the NOC to the County, we recommend releasing the 
remaining retention amount to finalize the  last payment of the project.   The total amount retained for 
the project is $55,695.53. 
 

The original contract amount  for  this project was $1,141,710.00.   The  final contract price  including all 
change  orders  due  to  1)  unforeseen  conditions  found  while  working  in  the  older  part  of  PHWD’s 
distribution  system, 2)  replacement of existing  FH  (PHWD  FH No. 16.01)  at 26025 Duval Way and 3) 
deductions for bid items and materials not constructed is $1,113,910.85. 
 

Project Summary 
 

  Current Month  Total   

Original Contract Amount  $ 1,141,710.00   

Approved Change Orders  <$ 28,640.40> <$ 27,799.15>  <2.4%> 

Final Contract Amount  $ 1,113,910.85   

Previously Paid  $ 1,035,204.80   

Current Request (Less Retention)  $ 23,010.52 $ 23,010.52   

Retention  $ 1,211.08 $ 55,695.53   

Total Value of Work Completed  $ 24,221.60 $ 1,113,910.85  100% 

Total Remaining on Contract  $ 0.00  0% 

 



Los Altos Hills County Fire District

FH Replacement Project ‐ Phase VIII

Progress Payment No. 6

July 1 to August 31, 2017

Stoloski and Gonzalez, Inc.

Bid  Description

Item Original Contract

U
n
it

Unit Price

Q
ty
.

Total Price

Q
ty
.

Unit Price Total Price

Q
ty
.

Unit Price Total Price

Q
ty
.

Amount Earned %

Q
ty
.

Amount Earned  %

Q
ty
.

Amount Earned  %

1 Repaint Fire Hydrant Head and Replace Hydrant Cap Chains EA $250.00 32 $8,000.00 0 $250.00 ‐$                     32 $250.00 $8,000.00 $0.00 0% 32 $8,000.00 100% 32 $8,000.00 100%

2 Remove and Replace 6‐inch Fire Hydrant Head EA $5,800.00 15 $87,000.00 0 $5,800.00 ‐$                     15 $5,800.00 $87,000.00 $0.00 0% 15 $87,000.00 100% 15 $87,000.00 100%

3
Remove and Reinstall 6‐inch Fire Hydrant Head and Break‐

Off/Check‐Valve, and Install Solid Spool/Extension
EA $10,800.00 6 $64,800.00 0 $10,800.00 ‐$                     6 $10,800.00 $64,800.00 $0.00 0% 6 $64,800.00 100% 6 $64,800.00 100%

4
Remove and Replace Fire Hydrant Head, Break‐Off/Check‐Valve, 

and Spool
EA $10,800.00 33 $356,400.00 7 $10,800.00 75,600.00$        40 $10,800.00 $432,000.00 $0.00 0% 40 $432,000.00 100% 40 $432,000.00 100%

5
Remove and Replace 6‐inch Fire Hydrant Assembly (FH Head, 

BO/CV, and Bury)
EA $10,500.00 8 $84,000.00 (2) $10,500.00 (21,000.00)$       6 $10,500.00 $63,000.00 $0.00 0% 6 $63,000.00 100% 6 $63,000.00 100%

6
Remove and Replace 6‐inch Fire Hydrant Assembly (FH Head, 

BO/CV, and Bury) to EX GV (To Remain)
EA $11,500.00 10 $115,000.00 (1) $11,500.00 (11,500.00)$       9 $11,500.00 $103,500.00 $0.00 0% 9 $103,500.00 100% 9 $103,500.00 100%

7
Remove and Replace 6‐inch Fire Hydrant Assembly (FH Head, 

BO/CV, and Bury) and FH GV
EA $12,900.00 7 $90,300.00 (2) $12,900.00 (25,800.00)$       5 $12,900.00 $64,500.00 $0.00 0% 5 $64,500.00 100% 5 $64,500.00 100%

8
Remove and Replace 6‐inch Fire Hydrant Assembly (FH Head, 

BO/CV, and Bury), FH GV, Tee  6‐inch Tie‐In
EA $14,500.00 1 $14,500.00 0 $14,500.00 ‐$                     1 $14,500.00 $14,500.00 $0.00 0% 1 $14,500.00 100% 1 $14,500.00 100%

9
Remove and Replace 6‐inch Fire Hydrant Assembly (FH Head, 

BO/CV, and Bury), FH GV, Tee  8‐inch Tie‐In
EA $15,000.00 2 $30,000.00 0 $15,000.00 ‐$                     2 $15,000.00 $30,000.00 $0.00 0% 2 $30,000.00 100% 2 $30,000.00 100%

10
Phase VIII FH No. 13 (PHWD FH No. 5.13) ‐ 28226 / 28254 Radcliffe 

Lane
LS $18,500.00 1 $18,500.00 (1) $18,500.00 (18,500.00)$       0 $18,500.00 $0.00 $0.00 0% 0 $0.00 0% 0 $0.00 0%

11
Phase VIII FH No. 18 (PHWD FH No. 5.05) ‐ Intersection of Liddcoat 

Drive and Stanford Court
LS $16,500.00 1 $16,500.00 1 $16,500.00 16,500.00$        2 $16,500.00 $33,000.00 $0.00 0% 2 $33,000.00 100% 2 $33,000.00 100%

12
Phase VIII FH No. 20 (PHWD FH No. 5.02) ‐ Across from 14377 / 

14425 Liddicoat Circle
LS $16,500.00 1 $16,500.00 (1) $16,500.00 (16,500.00)$       0 $16,500.00 $0.00 $0.00 0% 0 $0.00 0% 0 $0.00 0%

13
Phase VIII FH No. 28 (PHWD FH No. 8.01) ‐ Intersection of Page Mill 

Road and Paseo Del Roble Drive
LS $16,500.00 1 $16,500.00 0 $16,500.00 ‐$                     1 $16,500.00 $16,500.00 $0.00 0% 1 $16,500.00 100% 1 $16,500.00 100%

14
Phase VIII FH No. 57 (PHWD FH No. 12.04) ‐ 28008 / 28210 Natoma 

Rd (Yuba Lane)
LS  $      14,500.00  1 $14,500.00 (1) $14,500.00 (14,500.00)$       0 $14,500.00 $0.00 $0.00 0% 0 $0.00 0% 0 $0.00 0%

15
Phase VIII FH No. 67 (PHWD FH No. 12.41) ‐ 27474 Sunrise Farm 

Road
LS  $      14,500.00  1 $14,500.00 0 $14,500.00 ‐$                     1 $14,500.00 $14,500.00 $0.00 0% 1 $14,500.00 100% 1 $14,500.00 100%

16
Phase VIII FH No. 96 (PHWD FH No. 16.42) ‐ Across from 12305 / 

12335 Stonebrook Court
LS  $      16,500.00  1 $16,500.00 0 $16,500.00 ‐$                     1 $16,500.00 $16,500.00 $0.00 0% 1 $16,500.00 100% 1 $16,500.00 100%

17
Phase VIII FH No. 119 (PHWD FH No. 12.39) ‐ 12992 / 12998 Vista 

Del Valle
LS  $      14,500.00  1 $14,500.00 0 $14,500.00 ‐$                     1 $14,500.00 $14,500.00 $0.00 0% 1 $14,500.00 100% 1 $14,500.00 100%

18 Remove and Replace Gate Valve Box and Adjust to Grade EA  $            350.00  15 $5,250.00 15 $350.00 5,250.00$          30 $350.00 $10,500.00 11 $3,850.00 37% 19 $6,650.00 63% 30 $10,500.00 100%

19 Remove and Replace Gate Valve Box and Riser EA  $            250.00  59 $14,750.00 (11) $250.00 (2,750.00)$         48 $250.00 $12,000.00 $0.00 0% 48 $12,000.00 100% 48 $12,000.00 100%

20 Remove and Replace Fire Hydrant Retaining Wall EA  $         4,000.00  1 $4,000.00 0 $4,000.00 ‐$                     1 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $0.00 0% 1 $4,000.00 100% 1 $4,000.00 100%

21 Install Fire Hydrant Retaining Wall EA  $         3,800.00  8 $30,400.00 (1) $3,800.00 (3,800.00)$         7 $3,800.00 $26,600.00 $0.00 0% 7 $26,600.00 100% 7 $26,600.00 100%

22 Replace and Install Fire Hydrant Bollard EA  $            550.00  30 $16,500.00 8 $550.00 4,400.00$          38 $550.00 $20,900.00 $0.00 0% 38 $20,900.00 100% 38 $20,900.00 100%

23 Paint New/ Re‐Paint Existing Fire Hydrant Bollard EA  $            200.00  43 $8,600.00 5 $200.00 1,000.00$          48 $200.00 $9,600.00 4 $800.00 8% 44 $8,800.00 92% 48 $9,600.00 100%

24 Replace and Install Fire Hydrant Marker Post EA  $            250.00  6 $1,500.00 (2) $250.00 (500.00)$             4 $250.00 $1,000.00 4 $1,000.00 100% 0 $0.00 0% 4 $1,000.00 100%

25 Replace Existing Residential 1‐inch Water Service Connection EA  $         2,600.00  4 $10,400.00 (4) $2,600.00 (10,400.00)$       0 $2,600.00 $0.00 $0.00 0% 0 $0.00 0% 0 $0.00 0%

26 Replace Existing Residential 2‐inch Water Service Connection EA  $         3,800.00  1 $3,800.00 (1) $3,800.00 (3,800.00)$         0 $3,800.00 $0.00 $0.00 0% 0 $0.00 0% 0 $0.00 0%

27 1‐inch Air Combination Valve EA  $         4,400.00  1 $4,400.00 (1) $4,400.00 (4,400.00)$         0 $4,400.00 $0.00 $0.00 0% 0 $0.00 0% 0 $0.00 0%

28
Replace Existing 6‐inch FH Gate Valve (Only As Directed by the 

District)
EA  $         2,600.00  5 $13,000.00 (3) $2,600.00 (7,800.00)$         2 $2,600.00 $5,200.00 $0.00 0% 2 $5,200.00 100% 2 $5,200.00 100%

29
Replace Existing FH's Gate Valve for a 6‐inch Connection (Only As 

Directed by the District)
EA  $         2,900.00  6 $17,400.00 (3) $2,900.00 (8,700.00)$         3 $2,900.00 $8,700.00 $0.00 0% 3 $8,700.00 100% 3 $8,700.00 100%

Prior Billing Total to DateOriginal Contract Amount Change Order Revised Contract Amount Earned This Period

19‐Phs VIII‐ProgressPayments ‐ PP06‐Draft Page 1 of 2 Job No. 10003.19



Los Altos Hills County Fire District

FH Replacement Project ‐ Phase VIII

Progress Payment No. 6

July 1 to August 31, 2017

Stoloski and Gonzalez, Inc.

Bid  Description

Item Original Contract

U
n
it

Unit Price

Q
ty
.

Total Price

Q
ty
.

Unit Price Total Price

Q
ty
.

Unit Price Total Price

Q
ty
.

Amount Earned %

Q
ty
.

Amount Earned  %

Q
ty
.

Amount Earned  %

Prior Billing Total to DateOriginal Contract Amount Change Order Revised Contract Amount Earned This Period

30
Replace Existing FH's Gate Valve for a 8‐inch Connection (Only As 

Directed by the District)
EA  $         3,000.00  3 $9,000.00 (3) $3,000.00 (9,000.00)$         0 $3,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 0% 0 $0.00 0% 0 $0.00 0%

31 Replace Asphalt Concrete Pavement / Trench Repair SF  $              13.00  720 $9,360.00 406 $13.00 5,278.00$          1126 $13.00 $14,638.00 $0.00 0% 1126 $14,638.00 100% 1126 $14,638.00 100%

32 Replace Asphalt Concrete Berm LF  $              40.00  15 $600.00 (6) $40.00 (240.00)$             9 $40.00 $360.00 $0.00 0% 9 $360.00 100% 9 $360.00 100%

33 Replaced Curb and Gutter LF  $              75.00  40 $3,000.00 (40) $75.00 (3,000.00)$         0 $75.00 $0.00 $0.00 0% 0 $0.00 0% 0 $0.00 0%

34 Replace Thermoplastic Traffic Stripes LF  $              30.00  25 $750.00 53 $30.00 1,590.00$          78 $30.00 $2,340.00 78 $2,340.00 100% 0 $0.00 0% 78 $2,340.00 100%

35 Water Tank Truck LS  $         8,000.00  1 $8,000.00 (1) $8,000.00 (8,000.00)$         0 $8,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 0% 0 $0.00 0% 0 $0.00 0%

36 Install Construction Funding Signs LS  $         3,000.00  1 $3,000.00 0 $3,000.00 ‐$                     1 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $0.00 0% 1 $3,000.00 100% 1 $3,000.00 100%

Change Orders

Change Order No. 1 ‐ Item No. 1 to 12 1 $6,598.70 6,598.70$          1 $6,598.70 $6,598.70 $0.00 0% 1 $6,598.70 100% 1 $6,598.70 100%

Change Order No. 2 ‐ Item No. 1 to 16 1 $9,942.55 9,942.55$          1 $9,942.55 $9,942.55 $0.00 0% 1 $9,942.55 100% 1 $9,942.55 100%

Change Order No. 3 ‐ Item No. 1 to 2 1 $16,231.60 16,231.60$        1 $16,231.60 $16,231.60 1 $16,231.60 100% 0 $0.00 0% 1 $16,231.60 100%

Contract Amount $1,141,710.00 ($27,799.15) $1,113,910.85

  Amount Earned   $24,221.60 2% $1,089,689.25 98% $1,113,910.85 100%

Retention (5%) ($1,211.08)   ($55,695.53)

Progress Payment No. 01 ($193,372.50)

Progress Payment No. 02 ($259,397.50)

Progress Payment No. 03 ($203,395.00)

Progress Payment No. 04 ($245,953.77)

Progress Payment No. 05 ($133,086.03)

 

Amount Due $23,010.52   $23,010.52

Amount Remaining on Contract       $0.00 0%

Prepared By

Joubin Pakpour, P.E.

District Engineer

JP

19‐Phs VIII‐ProgressPayments ‐ PP06‐Draft Page 2 of 2 Job No. 10003.19



 
 

 

Los Altos Hills County Fire District 
Fire Hydrant Replacement Project – Phase VIII 

10003.19 
Change Order No. 3 

Stoloski & Gonzalez, Inc. 
August 31, 2017 

 
Item No. 1  –  Replace Existing FH (PHWD FH No. 16.01) – 26025 Duval Way 
 
On 8/16/17 and 8/22/17 Stoloski & Gonzalez, Inc. (SGI) mobilized to replace the leaking existing old dry‐
barrel  fire hydrant  (FH) assembly  (PHWD FH No. 16.01)  located along  the property  frontage of 26025 
Duval Way. 
 
The additional time and materials associated with this change in scope of work is $ 12,800.00. 
 
Total Cost of Item No. 1 ‐                         $ 12,800.00 
Total Increase of Working Days for Item No. 1 ‐                      2 Days 
 
Item No. 2  –  Repair Existing Residential Water Service – 26044 Duval Way 
 
On 8/16/17 while working to expose the existing 6‐inch CIP water main and FH  (PHWD FH No. 16.01) 
assembly to be replaced at 26025 Duval Way SGI damaged an existing non‐standard 1‐inch residential 
water service for 26044 Duval Way that was mismarked in the field by PHWD. 
 
The additional cost (time only) associated with SGI replacing the damaged 1‐inch residential service and 
water main saddle per Purissima Hills Water District’s (PHWD) direction is $3,431.60.  (PHWD provided 
all materials to repair/ replace the water service.) 
 
Total Cost of Item No. 2 ‐                            $3,431.60 
Total Increase of Working Days for Item No. 2 ‐                      1 Days 
 
 
Total Cost of Change Order No. 3 ‐                       $ 16,231.60 
Total Increase of Working Days for Change Order No. 3 ‐                      3 Days 
 
 
   





 

 

Los Altos Hills County Fire District 
Fire Hydrant Replacement Project – Phase VIII 

Project No. 10003.19 
Balancing Change Order No. 3 

Stoloski & Gonzalez, Inc. 
August 31, 2017 

 
Bid Item No. 18  –  Additional Remove and Replace Gate Valve Box and Adjust to Grade 
An  additional  15  remove  and  replace  gate  valve  box  and  adjust  to  grade were  installed  during  the 
project. 
The original contract amount for Bid Item No. 18 was increased by:  $5,250.00 
 
Bid Item No. 19  –  Deduct Remove and Replace Gate Valve Box and Riser 
A deduct of 11 remove and replace gate valve box and riser were not installed during the project. 
The original contract amount for Bid Item No. 19 was decreased by:  <$2,750.00> 
 
Bid Item No. 21  –  Deduct Install Fire Hydrant Retaining Wall 
A deduct of one (1) fire hydrant retaining wall was not installed during the project. 
The original contract amount for Bid Item No. 21 was decreased by:  <$3,800.00> 
 
Bid Item No. 22  –  Additional Replace and Install Fire Hydrant Bollard 
An additional eight (8) replace and install fire hydrant bollards were installed during the project. 
The original contract amount for Bid Item No. 22 was increased by:  $4,400.00 
 
Bid Item No. 23  –  Additional Paint New/ Re‐Paint Existing Fire Hydrant Bollard 
An additional five (5) paint new/ re‐paint existing fire hydrant bollards were installed during the project. 
The original contract amount for Bid Item No. 23 was increased by:  $1,000.00 
 
Bid Item No. 24  –  Deduct Replace and Install Fire Hydrant Marker Post 
A deduct of two (2) replace and install fire hydrant marker posts were not installed during the project. 
The original contract amount for Bid Item No. 24 was decreased by:  <$500.00> 
 
Bid Item No. 25  –  Deduct Replace Existing Residential 1‐inch Water Service Connection 
A deduct of four (4) replace existing residential 1‐inch water service connections were not installed 
during the project. 
The original contract amount for Bid Item No. 25 was decreased by:  <$10,400.00> 
 
Bid Item No. 26  –  Deduct Replace Existing Residential 2‐inch Water Service Connection 
A deduct of one (1) replace existing residential 2‐inch water service connection was not installed during 
the project. 
The original contract amount for Bid Item No. 26 was decreased by:  <$3,800.00> 
 
Bid Item No. 27  –  Deduct 1‐inch Air Combination Valve 
A deduct of one (1) 1‐inch air combination valve was not installed during the project. 
The original contract amount for Bid Item No. 27 was decreased by:  <$4,400.00> 
 
   



8/31/17 ‐ Page 2 
LAHCFD  ‐ Fire Hydrant Replacement Project Phase VIII – Balancing Change Order No. 03 
 

 

Bid Item No. 28  –  Deduct Replace Existing 6‐inch Fire Hydrant Gate Valve 
A deduct of three (3) replace existing 6‐inch fire hydrant gate valves were not installed during the 
project. 
The original contract amount for Bid Item No. 28 was decreased by:  <$7,800.00> 
 
Bid Item No. 29  –  Deduct Replace Existing Fire Hydrant Gate Valve for a 6‐inch Connection 
A deduct of three (3) replace existing fire hydrant gate valve for a 6‐inch connection was not  installed 
during the project. 
The original contract amount for Bid Item No. 29 was decreased by:  <$8,700.00> 
 
Bid Item No. 30  –  Deduct Replace Existing Fire Hydrant Gate Valve for a 8‐inch Connection 
A deduct of three (3) replace existing fire hydrant gate valve for a 8‐inch connection was not  installed 
during the project. 
The original contract amount for Bid Item No. 30 was decreased by:  <$9,000.00> 
 
Bid Item No. 31  –  Additional Replace Asphalt Concrete Pavement/ Trench Repair 
An  additional  406  SF  to  replace  asphalt  concrete  pavement/  trench  repair was  installed  during  the 
project. 
The original contract amount for Bid Item No. 31 was increased by:  $5,278.00 
 
Bid Item No. 32  –  Deduct Replace Asphalt Concrete Berm 
A deduct of 6 LF to replace asphalt concrete berm was not installed during the project. 
The original contract amount for Bid Item No. 32 was decreased by:  <$240.00> 
 
Bid Item No. 33  –  Deduct Replace Curb and Gutter 
A deduct of 40 LF to replace curb and gutter was not installed during the project. 
The original contract amount for Bid Item No. 33 was decreased by:  <$3,000.00> 
 
Bid Item No. 34  –  Additional Replace Thermoplastic Traffic Stripes 
An additional 53 LF to replace thermoplastic traffic stripes was installed during the project. 
The original contract amount for Bid Item No. 34 was increased by:  $1,590.00 
 
Bid Item No. 35  –  Deduct Water Tank Truck 
A deduct of one (1) lump sum water tank truck was not used during the project. 
The original contract amount for Bid Item No. 35 was decreased by:  <$8,000.00> 
   









Description DEC (15) JAN (16) FEB (16) MAR (16) APR (16) MAY (16) JUNE (16) JUL (16) AUG (16) SEP (16) OCT (16) NOV (16) DEC (16) JAN (17) FEB (17) MAR (17) APR (17) MAY (17) JUN (17) JUL (17) AUG (17) SEP (17) TOTAL

(Actual) (Actual) (Actual) (Actual) (Actual) (Actual) (Actual) (Actual) (Actual) (Actual) (Actual) (Actual) (Actual) (Actual) (Actual) (Actual) (Actual) (Actual) (Actual) (Actual) (Actual) (Est.)

Preliminary & Final Design

Field Investigation, Planning, Design, Advertise 

& Award:  3,095$              10,609$   10,164$   11,476$   7,404$     12,675$   19,554$   21,029$   19,263$   10,187$   11,050$   10,130$     1,637$       457$          ‐$                ‐$                ‐$                ‐$                ‐$                ‐$                ‐$                2,340$        151,070$     

Sub‐Consultant (Tree Arborist):  ‐$                      ‐$              ‐$              ‐$              ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$               ‐$                ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$                  

Contingency (0%):  ‐$                      ‐$              ‐$              ‐$              ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$               ‐$                ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$                  

Sub‐total [1]:  3,095$              10,609$   10,164$   11,476$   7,404$    12,675$  19,554$  21,029$  19,263$  10,187$  11,050$  10,130$    1,637$       457$         ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               2,340$       151,070$     

Construction Management

Construction Management:  ‐$                      ‐$              ‐$              ‐$              ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             10,416$    13,172$     15,346$     16,193$    26,673$    30,477$    37,698$    29,155$    14,096$    8,186$      8,742$       210,154$     

Sub‐Consultant (Geotech & Tree Arborist):  ‐$                      ‐$              ‐$              ‐$              ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$               ‐$                ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               1,474$      ‐$               7,992$      380$         ‐$               ‐$               9,846$         

Contingency (0%):  ‐$                      ‐$              ‐$              ‐$              ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$               ‐$                ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$                  

Sub‐total [2]:  ‐$                      ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$            ‐$            ‐$             ‐$            ‐$            ‐$            ‐$            10,416$    13,172$     15,346$     16,193$    26,673$    31,951$    37,698$    37,147$    14,476$    8,186$      8,742$       220,000$     

Lowest Bidding Contractor's Construction Cost (Including 10% Contingency)

Construction:  ‐$                      ‐$              ‐$              ‐$              ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$               ‐$                ‐$               203,550$  273,050$  214,100$  253,800$  144,348$  ‐$               7,990$      44,872$     1,141,710$  

Construction (Not Used):  ‐$                      ‐$              ‐$              ‐$              ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$               ‐$                ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               (44,872)$   (44,872)$      

Contingency (10%):  ‐$                      ‐$              ‐$              ‐$              ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$               ‐$                ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               5,099$      (4,257)$     ‐$               ‐$               113,358$  114,200$     

Contingency (Not Used):  ‐$                      ‐$              ‐$              ‐$              ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$               ‐$                ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               (113,358)$ (113,358)$    

Sub‐total [3]:  ‐$                      ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$            ‐$            ‐$             ‐$            ‐$            ‐$            ‐$            ‐$               ‐$                ‐$               203,550$  273,050$  214,100$  258,899$  140,091$  ‐$               7,990$      ‐$               1,097,680$  

Total [4] = [1] + [2] + [3]:  3,095$              10,609$   10,164$   11,476$   7,404$     12,675$   19,554$   21,029$   19,263$   10,187$   11,050$   20,546$     14,809$     15,803$     219,743$   299,723$   246,051$   296,597$   177,238$   14,476$     16,176$     11,082$     1,468,750$  

Construction Management Added ‐ Replace Exist FH along Duval Way 

Construction Management:  ‐$                      ‐$              ‐$              ‐$              ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$               ‐$                ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               876$         3,045$      7,242$      ‐$               11,163$       

Sub‐Consultant (Geotech & Tree Arborist):  ‐$                      ‐$              ‐$              ‐$              ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$               ‐$                ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               805$         ‐$               805$             

Contingency (0%):  ‐$                      ‐$              ‐$              ‐$              ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$               ‐$                ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$                  

Sub‐total [5]:  ‐$                      ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$            ‐$            ‐$             ‐$            ‐$            ‐$            ‐$            ‐$               ‐$                ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               876$         3,045$      8,047$      ‐$               11,968$       

2015 to 2017

Los Altos Hills County Fire District (LAHCFD)

Preliminary Engineer's Opinion of Probable Construction Cost Estimate for Budgeting Purposes Only

for Preliminary & Final Design, Construction Management and Construction Phases

Fire Hydrant Replacement Project ‐ Phase VIII

Prepared for September 19, 2017 BOC Meeting

[ ] $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ,$ ,$ $ ,$

Construction Cost Added ‐ Replace Exist FH along Duval Way 

Construction:  ‐$                      ‐$              ‐$              ‐$              ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$               ‐$                ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               16,232$    ‐$               16,232$       

Contingency (0%):  ‐$                      ‐$              ‐$              ‐$              ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$               ‐$                ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$                  

Sub‐total [6]:  ‐$                      ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$            ‐$            ‐$             ‐$            ‐$            ‐$            ‐$            ‐$               ‐$                ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               ‐$               16,232$    ‐$               16,232$       

Total [7] = [5] + [6]:  ‐$                      ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$              ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$             ‐$                ‐$                ‐$                ‐$                ‐$                ‐$                ‐$                876$          3,045$       24,279$     ‐$                28,200$       

TOTAL [8] = [4] + [7]:  3,095$              10,609$   10,164$   11,476$   7,404$     12,675$   19,554$   21,029$   19,263$   10,187$   11,050$   20,546$     14,809$     15,803$     219,743$   299,723$   246,051$   296,597$   178,114$   17,521$     40,455$     11,082$     1,496,950$  

Prepared By: Pakpour Consulting Group, Inc.

Date: 9/8/17     Page 1 of 1
J:\Projects\LAHCFD ‐ 10003.00\19‐FH Replacement Project Phase VIII\Cost Estimate\Phase VIII\

19‐LAHCFD‐BOC‐Phase VIII‐Prelim Engr Est‐Budget Projections







































RECORDS RETENTION SCHEDULE LEGEND 
©1995 - 2017 Gladwell Governmental Services, Inc. (909) 337-3516 - all rights reserved 

Do not duplicate or distribute without prior written permission 

 
 
OFR (Office of Record):  The department that keeps the original or “record copy.”  Usually it is the department that originates the record, unless the item is for 
a District Board meeting (then it is the District Clerk.) 
 
Records Description:  The record series (a group of like records). 
 
Transitory Records:  Records that are not retained in the ordinary course of business, including without limitation: Preliminary drafts, notes, or interagency or 
intra-agency memoranda and records having only transitory value.  Examples:  Telephone messages, meeting room reservation schedules, logs, source 
records entered into a computer system that qualify as a “trusted system”, etc. 
 
Non-Record:  Documents, studies, books and pamphlets produced by outside agencies, preliminary drafts not retained by the District in the ordinary course of 
business. 
 
Retention/Disposition:  Active:  How long the file remains in the immediate office area (guideline) 
    Inactive:  How long the file is in off-site storage, stored on Optical Disk or Microforms (guideline) 
    Total Retention:  The total number of years the record will be retained active and inactive 
 

For file folders containing documents with different retention timeframes, use the document with the longest retention time. 
  P = Permanent 
  Indefinite = No fixed or specified retention period; used for databases, because the data fields are interrelated.  
  
 Vital?  = Those records that are needed for basic operations in the event of a disaster. 
 
 Media Options (guideline) – the form of the record:   Mag = Computer Magnetic Media (hard drives, tapes, USB Drives, thumb drives, etc.) 
        Mfr = Microforms (aperture cards, microfilm, microfiche, or jackets)  
        Ppr = Paper   
        OD = Optical Disk, CD-r, DVD-r, WORM, or other media which does not allow changes 
 
 Scan / Import (guideline):   “S” indicates the record should be scanned into the document imaging system; 
     “I” indicates the record should be electronically imported into the document imaging system; 
     “M” indicates the record should be microfilmed 
 

Destroy Paper after Imaged & QCd (guideline, if record is imaged):  QCd=Quality Checked.  “Yes” indicates the paper version may be destroyed if the 
document has been imaged (microfilmed, scanned or imported onto Optical Disk – CD-R, WORM or DVD-R), and both the images and indexing have 
been QCd. 

 
Legend for legal citations (§:  Section) B&P:  Business & Professions Code (CA)  CBC:  California Building Code  
CC:  Civil Code (CA)   CCP:  Code of Civil Procedure (CA)   CCR:  California Code of Regulations (CA)   
CFC:  California Fire Code   CFR:  Code of Federal Regulations (US)  EC:  Elections Code (CA)     
EVC:  Evidence Code (CA)  FA:  Food & Agriculture Code (CA)   FC:  Family Code (CA)     
FTB:  Franchise Tax Board (CA)  GC:  Government Code (CA)   H&S:  Health & Safety Code (CA)    
HUD:  Housing & Urban Develop. (US) LC:  Labor Code (CA)     Ops. Cal. Atty. Gen.:  Attorney General Opinions (CA)   
PC:  Penal Code (CA)   R&T:  Revenue & Taxation Code (CA)  UFC:  Uniform Fire Code    
USC:  United States Code (US)  VC:  Vehicle Code (CA)    W&I:  Welfare & Institutions Code (CA) 
WC: Water Code 



Ver. 6.0 RECORDS RETENTION SCHEDULE Page RRS-1

Dept. RRS # Records Description Retention / Disposition Comments / Reference

Active          
(in home 

office)

Inactive    
(District 

Office, OD 
or Mfr)

Total 
Retention Vital? Media 

Options

Image:  
I=Import 
M=Mfr 

S=Scan

Destroy 
Paper after 
Imaged & 

QC'd?

Retentions begin when the act is completed, and imply a full file folder (e.g. last document + 2 years), since destruction is normally performed by file folder.                 

Litigation, complaints, claims, public records act requests, and/or investigations suspend normal retention periods (retention begins after settlement or completion).

Admin. / 
District 
Clerk

RRS-001 Agendas & Agenda Packets - 
District Commissioners 5 years 5 years

Yes:  Before 
Meeting 

Date
Mag, Ppr Department preference; GC 

§60201

Admin. / 
District 
Clerk

RRS-002 Agreements & Contracts  (All are 
attached to a Resolution) Completion P P Yes:  Before 

Completion
Mag, Mfr, 
OD, Ppr S Yes:  After 

Inactive

Department Preference; All 
infrastructure, JPAs, & Mutual 
Aid contracts are permanent for 
emergency preparedness; 
Statute of Limitations is 4 years; 
10 years for Errors & 
Omissions; CCP §§337. 
337.1(a), 337.15, 343; GC 
§60201 et seq.

Admin. / 
District 
Clerk

RRS-003 Audio Digital Recordings District 
Commission meetings 

30 Days or 
After Minutes 

are 
Approved, 

Whichever is 
Longer

30 Days or 
After Minutes 
are Approved, 
Whichever is 

Longer

Tape 
(Mag), OD

Department Preference; legally 
required for 30 days (or 
adoption of the minutes); GC 
§54953.5(b)

Admin. / 
District 
Clerk

RRS-004

Audited Financial Statements / 
Comprehensive Annual Financial 
Report (CAFR) with Audit 
Management Letters / Audit 
Reports

2 years P P Mag, Mfr, 
OD, Ppr S / I Yes:  After 

1 year

Department Preference for 
historical purposes; District 
Clerk retains original 
permanently; GC §60201 et 
seq.

Admin. / 
District 
Clerk

RRS-005
Backups (Computer) Network, All 
Files on Shared Drives 
(Incremental)

When No 
Longer 

Required

When No 
Longer 

Required
Yes Mag

Used for Disaster Recovery 
Purposes only; Considered a 
copy and can be destroyed 
when no longer required; 
retention based on 
administrative value; recycle 
tapes; GC §60201 et seq.

LOS ALTOS HILLS COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT  ©1995-2008 Gladwell Governmental Services, Inc. - all rights reserved
Do not duplicate or distribute without prior written consent 909.337.3516 Revision Adopted: 9/15/2015



Ver. 6.0 RECORDS RETENTION SCHEDULE Page RRS-2

Dept. RRS # Records Description Retention / Disposition Comments / Reference

Active          
(in home 

office)

Inactive    
(District 

Office, OD 
or Mfr)

Total 
Retention Vital? Media 

Options

Image:  
I=Import 
M=Mfr 

S=Scan

Destroy 
Paper after 
Imaged & 

QC'd?

Retentions begin when the act is completed, and imply a full file folder (e.g. last document + 2 years), since destruction is normally performed by file folder.                 

Litigation, complaints, claims, public records act requests, and/or investigations suspend normal retention periods (retention begins after settlement or completion).

Admin. / 
District 
Clerk

RRS-006 Bank Deposits 2 years 5 years 7 years Mag, Ppr

Department Preference; Meets 
municipal government auditing 
standards; Published articles 
show 3 - 7 years;  GC §60201

Admin. / 
District 
Clerk

RRS-007 Budgets:  Development, Drafts, 
etc.

When No 
Longer 

Required

When No 
Longer 

Required
Mag, Ppr

Department Preference; District 
Clerk maintains originals; longer 
for administrative value; GC 
§60200

Admin. / 
District 
Clerk

RRS-008 Claims & Litigation Final 
Disposition 5 years

Final 
Disposition + 

5 years

Yes:  Until 
Final 

Disposition

Mag, Mfr, 
OD,  Ppr S / M / I

Yes:  After 
Final 

Disposition

Department Preference; Statute 
of Limitations for most contracts 
is 4 years; wrongful death for 
construction is completion + 5 
years; CCP §§ 337 et seq.; GC 
§§ 945, 60201 et seq.; PC 
§832.5

District 
Engineer RRS-009 Construction Projects / Pipelines 

(Cal Water, Purissima, etc.)
Completion 
+ 5  years

Completion + 
5 years

Yes:  Until 
Completed Mag, Ppr

Preliminary Drafts, Copies, Non-
records (Cal Water / Purissima 
holds the originals); GC §60201 
et seq.

Admin. / 
District 
Clerk

RRS-010 Copies or duplicates of any 
record

Copies - 
When No 

Longer 
Required

Copies - 
When No 

Longer 
Required

  Mag Ppr GC §60200

Admin. / 
District 
Clerk

RRS-011

Correspondence - Establishing 
Policy (documents formation of 
policies or decision making 
process - e.g., Policy for using 
facilities)

Until 
Superseded

Superseded 
+ 2 years

Superseded + 
2 years

Mag, Mfr, 
OD, Ppr S / I

Yes:  When 
Supersede

d

Statewide guidelines propose 
Superseded + 2 or 5 years; GC 
§60201

LOS ALTOS HILLS COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT  ©1995-2008 Gladwell Governmental Services, Inc. - all rights reserved
Do not duplicate or distribute without prior written consent 909.337.3516 Revision Adopted: 9/15/2015



Ver. 6.0 RECORDS RETENTION SCHEDULE Page RRS-3

Dept. RRS # Records Description Retention / Disposition Comments / Reference

Active          
(in home 

office)

Inactive    
(District 

Office, OD 
or Mfr)

Total 
Retention Vital? Media 

Options

Image:  
I=Import 
M=Mfr 

S=Scan

Destroy 
Paper after 
Imaged & 

QC'd?

Retentions begin when the act is completed, and imply a full file folder (e.g. last document + 2 years), since destruction is normally performed by file folder.                 

Litigation, complaints, claims, public records act requests, and/or investigations suspend normal retention periods (retention begins after settlement or completion).

Admin. / 
District 
Clerk

RRS-012

Correspondence - ROUTINE 

(e .g. Administrative, 
Chronological, Communications, 
General Files, Letters, 
Memorandums, Miscellaneous 
Reports, Reading, Working Files, 
Weed Abatement, Unsuccessful 
Proposals, etc.)

2 years 2 years   Mag, Ppr GC §60201

Correspondence - TRANSITORY 
/ PRELIMINARY DRAFTS, I

(e.g. calendars, checklists, e-mail 
or social media posting  NOT 
made or retained for the purpose 
of preserving the informational 
content for future reference, that 
does not  have a material impact 
on the conduct of business, 
invitations, instant messaging, 
logs, mailing lists, meeting room 
registrations, supply inventories, 
telephone messages, transmittal 
letters, thank yous, requests from 
other cities, undeliverable 
envelopes, visitors logs, voice 
mails, webpages, etc.)

LOS ALTOS HILLS COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT  ©1995-2008 Gladwell Governmental Services, Inc. - all rights reserved
Do not duplicate or distribute without prior written consent 909.337.3516 Revision Adopted: 9/15/2015



Ver. 6.0 RECORDS RETENTION SCHEDULE Page RRS-4

Dept. RRS # Records Description Retention / Disposition Comments / Reference

Active          
(in home 

office)

Inactive    
(District 

Office, OD 
or Mfr)

Total 
Retention Vital? Media 

Options

Image:  
I=Import 
M=Mfr 

S=Scan

Destroy 
Paper after 
Imaged & 

QC'd?

Retentions begin when the act is completed, and imply a full file folder (e.g. last document + 2 years), since destruction is normally performed by file folder.                 

Litigation, complaints, claims, public records act requests, and/or investigations suspend normal retention periods (retention begins after settlement or completion).

Admin. / 
District 
Clerk

RRS-013

Correspondence - TRANSITORY 
/ PRELIMINARY DRAFTS, 
Interagency and Intraagency 
Memoranda not retained in the 
ordinary course of business 

Content NOT Substantive, or 
NOT made or retained for the 
purpose of preserving the 
informational content for future 
reference

(e.g. calendars, checklists, e-mail 
or social media posting that is 
NOT made or retained for the 
purpose of preserving the 
informational content for future 
reference, logs, mailing lists, 
meeting room registrations, 
supply inventories, text 
messages, transmittal letters, 
thank yous, undeliverable 
envelopes, voice mails, 
webpages, etc.)

When No 
Longer 

Required

When No 
Longer 

Required
  Mag, Ppr

Electronic and paper records 
are filed and  retained based 
upon their CONTENT.  Records 
where either the Content 
relates in a substantive way 
to the conduct of the public's 
business, or ARE made or 
retained for the purpose of 
preserving the informational 
content for future reference E-
mails or social media postings 
that ARE made or retained for 
the purpose of preserving the 
informational content for 
future reference are saved by 
printing them out and placing 
them in a file folder, or saving 
them electronically; If not 
mentioned here, consult the 
Attorney to determine if a record 
is considered transitory / 
preliminary drafts.  GC 
§§34090, 6252, 6254(a); 64 
Ops. Cal. Atty. Gen.  317 
(1981)); City of San Jose v. 
Superior Court (Smith). 
S218066. Supreme Court of 
California, 2017

LOS ALTOS HILLS COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT  ©1995-2008 Gladwell Governmental Services, Inc. - all rights reserved
Do not duplicate or distribute without prior written consent 909.337.3516 Revision Adopted: 9/15/2015



Ver. 6.0 RECORDS RETENTION SCHEDULE Page RRS-5

Dept. RRS # Records Description Retention / Disposition Comments / Reference

Active          
(in home 

office)

Inactive    
(District 

Office, OD 
or Mfr)

Total 
Retention Vital? Media 

Options

Image:  
I=Import 
M=Mfr 

S=Scan

Destroy 
Paper after 
Imaged & 

QC'd?

Retentions begin when the act is completed, and imply a full file folder (e.g. last document + 2 years), since destruction is normally performed by file folder.                 

Litigation, complaints, claims, public records act requests, and/or investigations suspend normal retention periods (retention begins after settlement or completion).

Admin. / 
District 
Clerk

RRS-014 County Signature Authorization 
Cards

Superseded 
+ 2 years

Superseded + 
2 years Mag, Ppr

Department Preference; Meets 
municipal government auditing 
standards;  GC §60201

Admin. / 
District 
Clerk

RRS-015

County Vouchers (Accounts 
Payable Authorizations with 
Invoices, Fiscal Reports & 
General Ledger (GL))

2 years 5 years 7 years Yes:  Until 
Paid

Mag, Mfr, 
OD, Ppr S/I Yes:  After 

1 year

May contain independent 
contractor's compensation, 
expense reimbursement, or 
District credit card records; 
Meets municipal government 
auditing standards; Sewage 
Sludge is required for 5 years; 
Published articles show 3 - 7 
years; 40  CFR 122.41(j)(2); 
WC §13263.2(b) et seq.; GC 
§60201(d)(12)

Admin. / 
District 
Clerk

RRS-016

Deeds, District Lot, Property 
Titles, Property Acquisitions, 
Conveyances, Annexations to the 
District, etc.

P P Yes (all) Mag, Mfr, 
OD,  Ppr S No GC §60201(d)(8)

Admin. / 
District 
Clerk

RRS-017 District Logo P P Yes (all) Mag, Mfr, 
OD,  Ppr S No GC §60201 et. seq.

Admin. / 
District 
Clerk

RRS-018 Drafts & Notes:  Drafts that are 
revised (retain final version) 

When No 
Longer 

Required

When No 
Longer 

Required
  Mag, Ppr

As long as the drafts and notes 
are not retained in the "Regular 
Course of Business".   GC 
§60201, GC §6254

Admin. / 
District 
Clerk

RRS-019 Ethics Training Certificates 5 years 5 years Mag Ppr GC §53235.2(b)

Admin. / 
District 
Clerk

RRS-038 Fire Hydrant Testing 10 years 10 years Mag Ppr GC §60201 et. Seq.

LOS ALTOS HILLS COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT  ©1995-2008 Gladwell Governmental Services, Inc. - all rights reserved
Do not duplicate or distribute without prior written consent 909.337.3516 Revision Adopted: 9/15/2015



Ver. 6.0 RECORDS RETENTION SCHEDULE Page RRS-6

Dept. RRS # Records Description Retention / Disposition Comments / Reference

Active          
(in home 

office)

Inactive    
(District 

Office, OD 
or Mfr)

Total 
Retention Vital? Media 

Options

Image:  
I=Import 
M=Mfr 

S=Scan

Destroy 
Paper after 
Imaged & 

QC'd?

Retentions begin when the act is completed, and imply a full file folder (e.g. last document + 2 years), since destruction is normally performed by file folder.                 

Litigation, complaints, claims, public records act requests, and/or investigations suspend normal retention periods (retention begins after settlement or completion).

District 
Consultant RRS-020

Fire Station Construction / CIP 
(Capital Improvement Project) 
Files - Administration File:  

Project Administration,  Advertising, 
Certified Payrolls, Confined Space 
Entries, Complaints (project-related), 
Cost of Construction, Insurance 
Certificates from Contractors, Labor 
Compliance, Logs, Meeting Minutes, 
Performance Bonds/Surety, Project 
Security files, Project Schedules,  
Real Estate Appraisals, etc.

Upon 
Completion

10 years or 
After 

Funding 
Agency 
Audit, if 

required, 
whichever is 

longer

Completion + 
10 years or 

After Funding 
Agency Audit, 

if required, 
whichever is 

longer

Yes:  Until 
Completed Mag, Ppr

Statute of Limitations for written 
contracts are four years from 
the date of breach; errors and 
omissions is 10 years; Death 
during construction is 10 years; 
CCP §§337., 337.1(a), 337.15 
GC §60200, Contractor has 
retention requirements in 48 
CFR 4.703

District 
Consultant RRS-021

Fire Station Construction / CIP 
(Capital Improvement Project) 
Files - Permanent File:  

Specifications, RFIs/RFPs, Change 
Orders, Materials Testing Reports, 
Notice of Completion, Soils Reports, 
Structural Calculations, Surveys, 
Submittals, Materials Submittals, 
Record Drawings ("As-Builts"), etc. 

Upon 
Completion P P Yes:  Until 

Completed
Mag, Mfr, 
OD, Ppr S Yes:  1 

year
For disaster preparedness 
purposes; GC §60201 et seq.

Admin. / 
District 
Clerk

RRS-022 Fixed Assets (Furniture, Tables, 
Copier, etc.) 2 years 5 years 7 years Mag, Ppr

Department Preference; Meets 
municipal government auditing 
standards;  GC §60201

Admin. / 
District 
Clerk

RRS-023

FPPC 700 Series Forms 
(Statement of Economic 
Interests):  DESIGNATED 
EMPLOYEES & PUBLIC 
OFFICIALS (specified in the 
District's Conflict of Interest code)

7 years 7 years Mag, Mfr, 
OD,  Ppr S Yes

Department preference (Public 
Officials are only required for 4 
years);; GC §81009(e)(g),  GC 
§81009(f)(g)

LOS ALTOS HILLS COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT  ©1995-2008 Gladwell Governmental Services, Inc. - all rights reserved
Do not duplicate or distribute without prior written consent 909.337.3516 Revision Adopted: 9/15/2015



Ver. 6.0 RECORDS RETENTION SCHEDULE Page RRS-7

Dept. RRS # Records Description Retention / Disposition Comments / Reference

Active          
(in home 

office)

Inactive    
(District 

Office, OD 
or Mfr)

Total 
Retention Vital? Media 

Options

Image:  
I=Import 
M=Mfr 

S=Scan

Destroy 
Paper after 
Imaged & 

QC'd?

Retentions begin when the act is completed, and imply a full file folder (e.g. last document + 2 years), since destruction is normally performed by file folder.                 

Litigation, complaints, claims, public records act requests, and/or investigations suspend normal retention periods (retention begins after settlement or completion).

Admin. / 
District 
Clerk

RRS-024 Historical Records P P Mag, Mfr, 
OD,  Ppr S No

District Clerk Determines 
Historical Significance; GC 
§60201

Admin. / 
District 
Clerk

RRS-039 Insurance Certificates 11 years 11 years Mag, Ppr
Department preference to cover 
all statute of limitations; CCP§ 
337 et seq., GC §60201(d)(3)

Admin. / 
District 
Clerk

RRS-025 Minutes:  District Commissioners P P Yes (all) Mag, Mfr, 
OD,  Ppr S No GC §60201(d)(3)

Admin. / 
District 
Clerk

RRS-026 Newspaper Clippings
When No 

Longer 
Required

When No 
Longer 

Required
Mag, Ppr Non-records; GC §60201 et 

seq.

Admin. / 
District 
Clerk

RRS-027
Notices:  Affidavits of Postings 
and Publications, Bid Notices, 
Legal Notices, etc.

2 years 2 years Mag, Ppr

Brown Act challenges must be 
filed within 30 or 90 days of 
action; GC §§60201, 
54960.1(c)(1)

Admin. / 
District 
Clerk

RRS-028 Ordinances P P Yes (all) Mag, Mfr, 
OD,  Ppr S No GC §60201 et. seq.

Admin. / 
District 
Clerk

RRS-029 Press Releases 2 years 2 years Mag, Ppr GC §60201 et seq.

Admin. / 
District 
Clerk

RRS-030

Public Education, Public Training 
Classes (Defensible Space, Fire 
Extinguishers, Brochures Written 
by the District, etc.)

P P Ppr Maintain 1 copy for historical 
purposes; GC §60201 et seq.

Admin. / 
District 
Clerk

RRS-031 Public Records Act Requests 2 years 2 years Mag, Ppr GC §60201(d)(5)

Admin. / 
District 
Clerk

RRS-032 Records Destruction 
Authorization Forms 10 years 10 years Mag, OD, 

Mfr, Ppr S Yes:  After 
2 years

Department Preference; GC 
§60201(b)(1)(B)

LOS ALTOS HILLS COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT  ©1995-2008 Gladwell Governmental Services, Inc. - all rights reserved
Do not duplicate or distribute without prior written consent 909.337.3516 Revision Adopted: 9/15/2015



Ver. 6.0 RECORDS RETENTION SCHEDULE Page RRS-8

Dept. RRS # Records Description Retention / Disposition Comments / Reference

Active          
(in home 

office)

Inactive    
(District 

Office, OD 
or Mfr)

Total 
Retention Vital? Media 

Options

Image:  
I=Import 
M=Mfr 

S=Scan

Destroy 
Paper after 
Imaged & 

QC'd?

Retentions begin when the act is completed, and imply a full file folder (e.g. last document + 2 years), since destruction is normally performed by file folder.                 

Litigation, complaints, claims, public records act requests, and/or investigations suspend normal retention periods (retention begins after settlement or completion).

Admin. / 
District 
Clerk

RRS-033 Records Retention  Schedules When 
Superseded P P Mag, OD, 

Mfr, Ppr S Yes:  After 
2 years

Department Preference; GC 
§60201(b)(1)(B)

Admin. / 
District 
Clerk

RRS-034
Reference Materials: Brochures, 
Manuals, Policies, Procedures & 
Reports 

When No 
Longer 

Required - 
Minimum of 
Superseded 

When No 
Longer 

Required - 
Minimum of 
Superseded 

  Mag, Mfr, 
OD, Ppr S / I

Yes:  When 
Super-
seded

Documents of historical 
significance should be retained 
longer; GC §60201

Admin. / 
District 
Clerk

RRS-035

Reports and Studies - White 
Papers, Issue Papers, Position 
Papers, Scientific Studies (Byrne 
Preserve Study, etc.)

Minimum 2 
years

Minimum 2 
years   Mag, Ppr GC §60201

Admin. / 
District 
Clerk

RRS-036 Resolutions P P Yes (all) Mag, Mfr, 
OD,  Ppr S No GC §60201 et. seq.

Admin. / 
District 
Clerk

RRS-037 Software Licenses / Software and 
Hardware Manuals

When 
Superseded 
or Replaced

When 
Superseded 
or Replaced

Mag, Ppr

Department Preference 
(Preliminary documents);  the 
Lead Department should print 
out historical documents prior to 
replacing the data; GC §60200, 
60201 et seq.

LOS ALTOS HILLS COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT  ©1995-2008 Gladwell Governmental Services, Inc. - all rights reserved
Do not duplicate or distribute without prior written consent 909.337.3516 Revision Adopted: 9/15/2015
















































































	20171119_LAHCFD_Agenda
	20171119_LAHCFD_AI03
	20171119_LAHCFD_AI04
	20171119_LAHCFD_AI05a
	20171119_LAHCFD_AI05b
	20171119_LAHCFD_AI05c
	20171119_LAHCFD_AI06a
	PAGE 1 - Cover Letter
	PAGE 2 - Map with Population Density Zones
	PAGE 3 - AVG RESP TIME
	PAGE 4 - 2017 CHART
	PAGE 5 - 2016 Chart
	PAGE 6 - 2015 Chart
	PAGE 7 - CENTILES
	PAGE 8 - HISTOGRAM
	PAGE 9 - INCIDENT TYPES BY YEAR
	PAGE 11 - $ LOSS

	20171119_LAHCFD_AI06b
	PAGE 1 - Cover Letter
	PAGE 2 - Map with Population Density Zones
	PAGE 3 - Avg Resp Time
	PAGE 4 - 2017 Chart
	PAGE 5 - 2016 Chart
	PAGE 6 - 2015 Chart
	PAGE 7 - Centiles
	PAGE 8 - Histogram
	PAGE 9 - Incident Types
	PAGE 10 - Pie
	PAGE 11 - $ Loss

	20171119_LAHCFD_AI07a
	20171119_LAHCFD_AI07b
	20171119_LAHCFD_AI07c
	20171119_LAHCFD_AI08
	20171119_LAHCFD_AI09
	20171119_LAHCFD_AI09a
	20171119_LAHCFD_AI09b
	20171119_LAHCFD_AI10a
	20171119_LAHCFD_AI10aa
	20171119_LAHCFD_AI11b
	20171119_LAHCFD_AI11c
	20171119_LAHCFD_AI12



